appfnmm e
i

|
| AN AMERICAN NATIONAL STANDARD

I IAPMD/ANSI UPC | - 2015

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®
Guide to Important Code Changes

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 1



Chapter 2 Definitions

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

203.0
Accepted Engincering Practice. That which conforms to technical or scientific-based principles,
tests, or standards that are aceepted by the engineering profession.

205.0
Combination Temperature and Pressure-Reliel Valve, A reliel valve that actuates when a set
temperitture, pressure, or both is reached. Also known as a T&P Valve,

207.0
Expansion Joint. A fitting or arransement of pipe and fitines that permuts the contraction and
cxpansion of a piping system.

Accepted Engineering Practice

The term “accepted engineering practice” was previously used in Sections 309.1, 501.1, 911.1,
1208.7.5.1, 1314.1, and E 35.1 without being defined. This definition assists the end user in applying
and enforcing this term, and is consistent with terminology used in other industry standards.

Combinatien Temperature and Pressure-Reliel Valve

The term “combination temperature and pressure relicf valve™ was used in Sections 505.2 and 608.3
without being defined. This new definition also defines the industry shortened and often used term
ilT & p.1'

Expansion Joint

The term “expansion joint” was uscd in Scctions 705.10 and 1101.4 without being defined. These
Joints allow for movement when temperature fluctuations in piping systems are present and must be
addressed.

Accepted Engineering Practice

This definition clearly defines the parameters required to substantiate a plumbing system will meet
the minimum requirements accepted by known practices. These requirements are no longer
ambiguous and will require the designer to prove that the proper engincering practices have been
met with quantifiable and proven results. This may include references to cstablished design
principles and other testing data, American Socicty of Plumbing Engincers (ASPE) publishes design
handbooks that arc generally accepted by the industry.

Combination Temperature and Pressure-Relief Valve

This relicf valve combines both temperature relicfand pressure relicf in one valve and is an important
safety featurc for storage type water heating systems and inspectors and installers must verify the
installation of such valve. Other methods and mechanical devices that only meet one such
requirement may not be used.

When the water system is equipped with a storage water heater, pressures rise even more because of
the increase in temperature and the high volume of water contained in the tank. All storage water
heaters are required to be equipped with a combination temperature and pressure relief valve (T&P
valve). Note in figure 1, the combination T&P valve has a temperature sensing tube. The pressure
relief valve does not. Storage water heaters must be manufactured to the ANSI Z21.10 series of
standards,

2015 Unifarm Plumbing Code®



Chapter 2 Definitions (continued)

Expansion Joint
Where required for piping systems, specifically ABS and PVC systems, expansion joints may be

accounted for by using offscts. Although a listed expansion joint may be installed according to their
installation instructions this is not the only way to achicve allowance for expansion and contraction.
Frequent changes in direction, or offscts, will meet the intent of the code to allow for thermal

cxpansion.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes



204.0 Bottle Filling Station and 206.0 Drinking Fountain

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

204.0
Bottle Filling Station. A plumbing fixture connected to the potable water distribution system and

or_containcrs not less than 10 inches (254 mm) in height. Such fixtures can be separate from or
inteeral to a drinking fountain and can incomorate a water filter and a cooling svstem for chilling

the drinking water,

206.0
Drinking Fountain. A plumbing fixture connected to the potable water distribution svstem _and

sanitary drainage system_that provides drinking water in a flowing stream so_that the user ca

This definition was added 1o define bottle filling stations in code since additional language has been
added 415.2 rcgarding the installation of these fixturcs. Pleasc see the code change information in
scction 4135.2 for more detailed information,

Code uscrs must be able to properly identify bottle filling stations from drinking fountains. More
information regarding bottle filling stations can be found in section 415.2, which is also cover later
in this document.

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



220 Registered Design Professional

What Changed 220.0 Registered Design Professivnal. An individual who is registered or licensed by the laws of
the state to perform such design work_in the jurisdiction,

Why It Changed This addition provides a definition and correlates the industry recognized term “registered design
professional™ with the related terms currently used in the Uniform Plumbing Code (UPC) and other
industry related codes. The term had been used within the UPC in previous editions of the code, but
was undefined.

What It Means As a code official or an installer/contractor the term Registered Design Professional can be

To Me confusing and have different meanings based on the state where the code is applied. By defining the
term and meaning of “Registered Design Professional” the code change gives more clarity to the
end user of the code.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 5



312.6 Freezing Protection

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

312.6 Freezing Protection. No watcr, soil, or waste pipe shall be installed or permitted outside of a
building, in attics or crawl spaces, or in an exterior wall unless, where necessary, adequate provision
is made to proteet such pipe from freezing.

The current text docs not account for locations such as attics and crawl spaces that may be
susceptible to freezing temperatures. Thercfore, the revision is necessary to protect piping installed
in such locations from frcezing,

The installer and inspectors must be aware of locations that may allow piping 10 be exposcd to
freczing.  Piping shall not be installed in these arcas unless provisions are in place to prevent
freezing. The addition of attics and crawl spaces clarifies such locations.

Piping can be protected by using insulation or heat tapes. However, local conditions and the
authority having jurisdiction have the final say over how protection is deemed “adequate.”

Use pipe insulator

Example of Pipe Insulation
Image Courtesy of wikitlow

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



312.14 Exposed PVC Piping

What Changed

Why it Changed

What It Means
To Me

312.14 Exposed PVC Piping. PVC piping shall not be exposed to direct sunlight,

Exceptions:

(1) PVC piping exposed to sunlight that is protected by water based synthetic latex paints.

(2) PVC piping wrapped with not less than 0.04 inch (1.02 mm) thick tape or othenvise protected
from UV deoradation

The installation standards and manufacturer’s instructions did not allow for PVC pipe 1o be exposed
to dircct sunlight except for short periods of time during construction. Many jurisdictions do not
adopt the installation standards. This protection is now found in the body of the code and complies
with the requircments of the manufacturer.

Over time PVC installed in direct sunlight will break down and deteriorate and, eventually fail.
Installers will now have guidelines for the installation of PVC in direct sunlight as long as certain
specific conditions are met. Installers and inspectors must ensure that PVC piping exposed to direct
sunlight comply with the methods of protection detailed in this scction. Lack of enforcement will
cause increased cost to the end user and possible liability issucs as system failure could occur
resulting in damages. The local AHJ will have the responsibility to require the improperly installed
system to be replaced properly.

Inspectors will nced to identify that the paint uscd is water based and synthetic latex. Oil based
paints arc not compatible with PVC. Inspectors should be familiar with the appropriate types of
paint and be able to ideniify it when applied to PVC piping in the ficld. If unsure, it would not be
unrcasonable for the inspector to ask to sce a can of the paint used. When tape mecting the
specifications of this section is used, the inspector should verify that the piping is completely
covered and no gaps in the tape are present. For piping that decs not have some sort of paint or tape
protection, the inspector should examine the piping for indications that the PVC piping is listed for
exposure to direct sunlight.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 7



314.1 Trenches

What Changed

Why [t Changed

What It Means
To Me

314.1 Trenches. Trenches deeper than the footing of a building or structure, and paralleling the
sam, shall be located not less than 45 degrees (0.79 rad) therefrem from the bottom exierior edge of
the footing, or as approved in accordance with Section 301.0 efthis-cade,

The text in this section was not clear and was commonly misunderstood. This led to many installers
and inspectors performing this measurement from the wrong point. The new text clarifies the intent
of the section.

The code now gives a clear understanding that the mcasurement starts the bottom cdge of the
footing. Installers must be sure that they are measuring appropriatcly. Due the frequency in which
this scction was misapplicd previously, inspectors are going to have to be aware that this is likcly to
be the source of frequent violations until the standard practice is well understood.

If the measurement that this section calls for is done incorrectly, it is compromising the integrity of
the ground supporting the load transferred through the footing. This could lead to foundation failure,
not pipe failure. The main point is to protect the foundation of the building.

Sincc the relation of the 45 degree angle 1o the vertical height of the trench creates an isosceles
trangle where the two legs arc equal, we know that the height from the bottom of the trench to the
bottom cdge of the footing will equal the horizontal distance from the bottom cedge of the footing to
the closest edge of the trench. Therefore, if the horizontal distance is cqual to or greater than the
vertical distance, then the trench is at an approved distance from the footing.

ding N
Footing N

45° {0 79 rad)

PN
INCORRECT CORRECT

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



314.4 Excavations

What Changed

Why 1t Changed

What It Means
To Me

314.4 Excavations. Excavations shall be completely backfilled as soon after inspection as
practicable. Precaution shall be taken to cnsure compactness of backfill around piping without
damage to such piping. Trenches shall be backfilled in thin layers to 12 inches (305mm) above the
top of the piping with clean carth, which shall not contain stones, boulders, cinderfill, frozen

earth, construction debris, or other materials that will damage or break the piping or cause corrosive
action. Mechanical devices such as bulldozers, graders, cic., shall be permiited to then be used to
complete backfill to grade. Fill shall be properly compacted. Precautions shall be taken to ensure
permanent stability for pipe laid in filled or made ground.

Underground thermoplastic pipe and fittings for sewers and other gravity flow_applications shall
be installed in accordance with this code and Section 314.4.1,

314.4.1 Instaliation of Thermoplastic Pipe and Fittings. Trench width for thermoplastic sewer
pipe shall be 1.25 times the outside diameter of the piping plus 12 inches (305 mm) or the outside
diameter of the piping plus 16 inches {406 mim). Thermoplastic piping shall be bedded in not less
than 4_inches (102 mm) of granular fill supporting the piping. The backfill for thermoplastic piping
shall be compacted along the sides of the piping in 6 inch (152 mm) lavers and continue to not less
than 12 inches (305 mm) abave the piping. Compaction shall be not less than a 85 percent standard

proctor density,

This change to the installation requirements will help to clarify the correct installation of
thermoplastic piping in trenches.

This change provides for preseriptive methods and or procedures to guide the installer and the
inspector in the proper installation of thermoplastic piping systems.

The reason for controlling the trench width is to
cnable the thermoplastic piping to gain side fill
support from the compaction. If the trench width  (Naww -,
is wider, the side fill support is more difficult to -
maintain and, if it is narrower than the ~

requirement, there is not cnough room to ‘(\
compact the side fill support in 6 inch layers. \

The reason for granular fill support is to cnable A
the thermoplastic piping to embed itsclf in the B
fill, and increase the bedding angle which takes \ : BAgkH
advantage of the side fill support to prevent the
piping from flattening duc to the load of the
backfill on top of the pipc. A cubic foot of dirt
weighs about 45 pounds and if wet the weight
increases. Because plastic piping is flexible the Stoped Wall Bell Hole in Bedding

weight exerted on the top of the pipe forces the (e Reure) ToenechBocsomimisitie)

sides of the pipe to deflect outward. or Foundation {As Ruquired)

The compaction is necessary to prevent the Image Courtesy of Georg Fischel Harvel

deflection of the pipe from the weight of the backfill, Compaction of the side [l prevents the weight
on top of the pipe from causing the pipe to become oval and leak or fail because of the fracture of
pipe walls. Undisturbed native soil is considered to be 100% standard proctor density so the 85%
compaction attempts to restore the soil back to its original state.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 8



320.0 Rehabilitation of Piping Systems

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

320.0 Rehabilitation of Piping Svstems,
320.1 General. Where pressure piping systems are rehabilitated using an epoxy lining system it shall
be in accordance with ASTM F2831.

ASTM F2831-2011 (Standard Practice for Internal Non Structural Epoxy Barrier Coating Material
Used in Rehabilitation of Metallic Pressurized Piping Systems) is a National Standard and was
accepted by the membership during the last cycle and included in Table 1401.1 of the 2012 code. This
standard is intended to cover products used in the rchabilitation of metallic pressurized piping
systems. Similar wording has been accepted in the IAPMO Green Code Supplement for 2012,
Accordingly, wording was added in the body of the code 1o reinforce the necessity of complying with
ASTM F2831 when using cpexy lining to rehabilitate pressure piping systems.

Until the development of ASTM F2831 there has been no uniform enforcement of requirements for
installing, testing, and quality control of cpoxy lining systems used in the rehabilitation of pressure
piping systems cven though they have been listed by various organizations, including I1APMO.

The addition of the requirements in the body of the code will reinforce compliance with this standard
and give the Authority Having Jurisdiction more tools to assure proper installation and use of these
procedures. Installers should be aware of this requirement for products installed in the rehabilitation of
metallic pressurized piping systems, as these requirements arc now enforccable by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction. Inspectors will have to be aware of and familiar with ASTM F2831-2011 to
cnsure it is properly followed. If these requirements are not met, the result could be pipe failure and
lead to added cost to cither the contractor to repair any damage or the owner, who is likely to seck
damages from the contractor. To prevent this, installers should be traincd on the standard and the
appropriate skills nceded for proper installation,

ASTM F2831 gives the inspector the authority to require third party testing to cnsure the provisions of
the standard are followed properly. Third party testing includes visual inspection at the opening and
exit of piping. Hand held probes may be used on piping up to 2™ and any piping over 2" a CCTV
shall be used to verity a 4° maximum length of piping. The pipe shall be tested to 150 psig or 1-1/2
times the working pressure. Flow rates must also be verified to ensure the piping mecets the minimum
flow rate requirements of local model codes. When used for potable water systems an annual
chemical extraction test must be performed to verify continued compliance with Scction 5 of
NSF/ANSI 61.

10

2015 Uniferm Plumbing Code®



407.0 Lavatories

What Changed

Why It Changed

407.0 Lavatories.

407.1  Application. Lavatories _shall _comply with ASME A112.19.1/CSA B43.2. ASME
Al12.19.2/CSA B45.1. ASME A112.19.3/CSA B45.4, ASME A112.19.12, CSA B45.5/[APMO
Z124, CSA B45.11/IAPMO Z401.

407.2 Watcr Consumpﬁnn The maximum water flow rate of faucets shall comply with Section

0.5 opm at 60 psi (1.9 L/m_at 414 kPa) and 2.2 epm at 60 psi (8.3 L/'m at 414 kPa) for private
lavatory Faucets in accordance with ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1.

4834 407.2.2 Metereding Faucets. Sel :
%la#aiﬁrﬂ#-ﬂﬂﬁﬂﬁﬂi—m—he#»e—!he—kﬂmem—ﬁuhm—h e :

SHRHMES, TR SEAbNHRS umﬁ»—r&mmmwﬂ—rm&n—% Mctcrcd faucets shall dclwcr a
maximum of 0.25 gallons (1.0 L} per metering cycle in accordance with ASME A112.18.1/CSA
Bi25.1.

4242 407.3 Limitation of Hot Water Temperature for Public Lavatories. Hot water delivered
from public-usc lavatorics shall be limited to a maximum temperature of 120°F (49°C) by a device
that is in accordance with ASSE 1070 or CSA B125.3. The water heater thermostat shall not be
considered a control for mecting this provision.

dﬂtil{dm-tinuwg—ﬁhﬂﬁ 407.5 Waste Outlet. Lavatories shall have a waste outlet and fixture
tailpicce not less than 1%, inches (32 mm) in diameter. Continuous wastes and fixture tailpicces shall
be constructed from the materials spccnf‘ cd in Sccnon 701 -H R e e roealod;

sopmless

h—&mlvp-rew

ih&H-uﬂe-H!HH-}ﬁ-&qﬂd-HH—{—t— —H—m&h&rﬂlmma—mmﬂ—éﬁﬁ}ﬁﬂﬂ—fe%mﬂﬁ—ﬂd—%mm!f :.mal-.

Frabbres:

mmmemmﬂ&m—%mmmﬂmﬂﬁmmﬂ—a hopihanssaier closelsand

rthﬂﬂl-‘-r—‘:i- :

: e PRl w e s - area. SHaimers
: : st R e s 4 slentto-the-area-oithe-tailpiece. Waste outlels
shall bc Qrovidcd with an approved siopper ot strainer.

407.6 Overflow, Overtlows shall be installed in accordance with Section 404 .1,

These changes places all material, water consumption, and application requirements for lavatories
into a single section of code that is similar in format to what was approved during the 2012 cycle for
other fixtures, such as: showers, bathtubs, bidets, dishwashing machines, drinking fountains, floor
drains, and sinks. This format will be more user-friendly for the end user than having to scarch
throughout Chapter 4 to obtain such requirements,

Mandatory reference standards have been added to Sections 406.1, 406.2.1, and 406.2.2 to assist the
cnd user in identifying lavatorics and toilets that arc approved based on material and performance
requirements without having to scarch throughout Table 1701.1. Adding mandatory reference
standards to the body of the code is one of the recommendations that has been made to the
Technical Committee by the Standards Task Group.

The provisions in Scction 701.4 (Continuous Wastes) have been incorporated in Section 406.4
(Waste Qutlet) as such provisions are alrcady addressed for other types of fixtures, except lavatonces,
throughout Chapter 4

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 11



407.0 Lavatories (continued)

What It Means Adding references to this scction allows the user to get the information without scarching the tables

To Me for the requirements.  This will make it morc user friendly and incorporating the language will
combine and simplify provisions already addressed. Inspectors and installers should be sure to usc
the language and references here instead of trying to find them whete they were previously located.
This will be especially important when documenting any potential violations.

12 2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



412.1.1 Nonwater Urinals

What Changed 40312.31.1 Nonwater Urinals. MNeswaterurinalsshall-be-listedand-complywith-the-apphicable
siandardsreferenseddaTable4044-Nonwater urinals shall have a barrier liquid sealant to maintain
a trap scal. Nonwaler urinals shall permit the uninhibited flow of waste through the urinal to the
sanitary drainage system. Nonwater urinals shall be cleaned and maintained in accordance with the
manufacturer’s instructions after installation. Where nonwater urinals are installed they-shath-haves
wierdisteibution, not less than onc water supplicd fixture rated at not less than 1 water supply fixture
unit (WSFU) shall be installed upstream on_the same drain line to facilitate drain line flow and
rinsing. Where nonwater urinals are instalied they shall have a water distribution line rough-in to the
urinal location to allow for the insiallation of an approved backflow prevention deviee in the cvent
of a retrofit.

Why It Changed Water is needed to clean the waste line from the nonwater urinals in the horizontal position. Without
it, sediment matter from urine, known as struvite, will collect and solidify in the drain piping leading
away from the fixture. Over time, this can create a blockage in the pipe requiring cither a mechanical
cleaning out of the pipe or replacement. The new language is based on similar language that was
alrcady found in Section L 402.3.1 of the UPC and is intended to mitigate this issue.

What It Means The installer must now install a water supplied fixture upstream of the urinals in this application.

To Me Doing so will add some material cost and labor time. However, installations of nonwater urinals have
been shown to be problematic much sooncer than expected due to the amount of usc and lack of proper
maintenance. Often, this results in complaints made to the installer/contractor, even if the actual
probicm is not duc to the installation. The water from the upstream fixture will help flush these waste
pipes and helps mitigate these problems. Because the required water distribution water line is
required and the waterless urinal is not noted until the time of final inspection, this requirement can
lcad 1o additional costs to install the fixture upstream of the wateriess urinal.

Inspectors need to verify that these installations comply with this new code requirement to help
manage the collection of deposits stemming from the high urine concentration these fixtures can
produce. Enforcing this new requirement can be tricky since the inspector may not know, at the time
of rough inspection, if a watcrless urinal is to be used. Sometimes, they are on the plans and
sometimes they are not.

The upstream fixture required in this code scction must be | WSFU or greater. Water is needed to
clean the waste line from the nonwater urinals. Technically, a WSFU assumcs a fixturc that has a
probability distribution for frequency of use. With an upstream fixture, the amount of water used to
facilitate drain rinsing will correspond to the frequency of use. There will be greater frequency of
use during times of congestion. When there is congestion, there is more use of the upstream fixture
and therefore greater volume is provided to rinsc the drain. When there is no congestion, there will
be less use of the upsiream fixiure, reducing the volume amount needed to rinse the drain.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 13



413.0 Flushing Devices

What Changed

Why It Changed

What [t Means
To Me

413.0 Flushing Devices fer-Water-Closess-and Urinals,

413.1-Applieation-Where Required.-Flshometervabves—Jushomotor tunks—or—{lush tanks—shall
o he-with-theapphesblestimdards-relerepoed i Table 0

H3:2-FlushingDeviees Required: Each watcr closct, urinal, ebisie clinical sink, or other plumbing
fixture that depends on trap siphonage to discharge its waste contents shall be provided with a
flushometer valve, flushometer tank, or flush tank designed and installed so as to supply water in
sufficient quantity and rate of flow to flush the contents of the fixture to which it is connected, to
cleanse the fixture, and to refill the fixture trap, without cxcessive water use. Flushing devices shall
meet antisiphon requircments in accordance with Section 603.5.

413.32 Flushometer Valves, Flushometer valves and tanks shall comply with ASSE 1037 or CSA
B125.3. and shall be_installed in_accordance with Scction_603.5.1. No manually controlled
flushometer valve shall be used 10 flush more than one urinal, and cach such urinal flushometer
valve shall be an approved, sclf-closing type discharging a predetermined quantity of water.
Flushometers shall be installed so that they will be accessible for repair. Flushometer valves shall
not be used where the water pressure is insufficient to properly operate them. Where the valve is
operated, it shall complete the cycle of operation automatically, opening fully, and closing
positively under the line water pressure. Each flushometer shall be provided with a means for
regulating the flow through it.

413.3 Flush Tanks. Flush tanks for manual flushing shall be equipped with a flush valve in
accordance with ASME A112.19.5/CSA B45.15 or CSA B125.3. and an antisiphon fill

valve (ballcock) that is in accordance with ASSE 1002 or CSA B1235.3 and installed in agcordance
with Section 603.5.2,

{rcmaining text unchanged)

The title of Scetion 413.0 was revised as this section deals with other fixtures besides water closcts
and urinals such as clinical sinks. In Section 413.1 (Where Required), the correct terminology for a
fixture used to receive the wastes from a bedpan, cte. within a health care facility is a “clinical sink”
and not a “clinic sink”. The provisions in Section 413.1 was also combined in the appropriate
scctions that address flushometer valves and tanks (Section 413.2 Flushometer Valves), and flush
tanks {Scction 413.3 Fill Valves) for case of usc.

Mandaiory reference standards have been added to Scctions 413.2 & 413.3 to assist the end user in
identitying flushometer valves and tanks, and the components within a flush tank, that arc approved
based on material and performance requircments without having to scarch throughout Table [701.1.
Adding mandatory reference standards to the body of the code is one of the recommendations that
have been made to the Technical Committce by the Standards Task Group,

The references made to Sections 603.5.1 & 603.5.2 arc necessary to ensure that such installations
arc done in accordance with the applicable backflow prevention requirements of Chapter 6.

Adding proper terminology and mandatory reference standards in the code will help the installer and
inspector to ensure compliance with the code. Backflow protection is always a priority and
inspectors and installers must ensure that an appropriate antisiphon fill valve is properly installed.
As with other sections in which the mandatory references have been moved to the body of the code,
inspectors should be surc to document the code scction rather than Table 1701.1 if an inappropriate
fixture is used.

14

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



415.2 Bottle Filling Stations

What Changed 415.2 Drinking Fountain Alternatives. Where food is consumed indoors, water stations shall be
permitted to be substituted for drinking fountains. Bottle filling stations shall be permitied to be
substituted for drinking fountains up to 30 percent_of the requirements for drinking fountains.
Drinking fountains shall not be required for an occupant load of 30 or less.

Why It Changed This change will allow the use of standalone bottle filling stations (without being attached to a
drinking fountain) as the market trends towards the use of thesc drinking water devices. In
addition, these devices are preferred because they are: (1) more hygienic, (2) save up o 50 pereent
of the water that is gencrated as wastewater when compared to using a traditional drinking
fountain, and (3) will aide in diverting waste generated from plastic bottles by providing a method
to refill them or other drinking containers.

What It Means The installer will not have to install a drinking fountain when bottle filling stations are being used.

To Me The inspector must verify that the bottle filling stations are in place at the time of final inspection.
Everyone invalved should be aware that bottle filling stations arc also subject to the Americans
With Disabilitics Act (ADA) requirements for plumbing and installations must mect these
requircments as well,

Bottle Filling Station

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 15 |



418.3 Location of Floor Drains

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

418.3 Location of Floor Drains. Floor drains shall be installed in the following arcas:

(1) Toilet rooms containing two or more water closets or a combination of one water closet and onc
urinal, except in a dwelling unit.

(2) Commercial kitchens and in accordance with Section 704.3.

(3) Laundry rooms in commercial buildings and common laundry facilities in multi-family
dwelling buildings.

4} Boiler rooms.,

Floor drains in boiler rooms have been required by the UMC for years. Floor drains and associated
piping arc plumbing items and they arc now represented in the plumbing code. These drains arc
mistakenly omitted by plumbers and plumbing engincers because they arc not familiar with the
requirements of the Uniform Mcchanical Code.

The addition of “boiler room™ to this scction in the UPC will make the inspector, installers and
engincers of these plumbing systems more aware of this requirement and the floor drain less likely
to be overlooked. It will now also be the responsibility of the plumbing inspector to ensure that
floor drains arc not overlooked during the installation process.

Boiler rooms require a floor drain for disposing of the accumulation of liquid wastes incident to
cleaning, recharging, and routine maintenance. Single-dwelling units (homes, apartments or condos)
are not required to have a floor drain.

16

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



421.0 Floor Sinks

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

421.0 Floor Sinks.
421.1 Application. Floor sinks shall comply with ASME A112.6.7.

421.2 Strainers. The waste outlet of a floor sink shall be provided with an approved strainer or grate
that is removable and accessible.

The UPC now contains provisions for floor sinks since they are commonty used as indirect waste receplors.
Section 421.1 assists the end user in identifying floor sinks that are approved based on material and
performance requircments without having to search throughout Table 1701.1. Strainers and grates must
be accessible and removable for cleaning and maintenance purposcs.

Strainers and grates must be aceessible and removable for cleaning and maintenance purposes. The presence
of a strainer in this application is to prevent the entrance of large object and creating a stoppage of the floor
sink drainage system, thus preventing flooding. It is impertant that inspectors and installers remember that
part of this code scction is 1o ensure that the strainer or grate is removable and accessible.

Floor Sink with Strainer
image Courtesy of MIFAB

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 17



501.1 Applicability,
505.1 Water Heaters, and 505.4 Indirect-Fired Water Heaters

What Changed

Why It Changed

S01.1 Applicability. The regulations of this chapter shall govern the construction, location, and
installation of fucl-burning and other tvpes of water heaters heating potable water, together with
chimneys, vents, and their connectors. The minimum capacity for storage water heaters shall be in
accordance with the first hour rating listed in Table 501.1(]). Pesish—construction—and
v sl ke e ﬂ—.i-_u}rrlnmh-e.*—u-ﬂﬂ—m.—ee-me._,—EFErIWeru—I-sHbH-bes.—ﬁm-rm!z!Lhﬁ'er %
mstreetons—und-appheablestandards and-shal-be-ofsuch-churaeter ss-to-secure the resultssoushi-io
he-abianed-by-this-eede: No watcer heater shall be hercinafier installed that does not comply with the
manufacturer’s installation instructions and the type and model of cach size thercof approved by the
Authority Having Jurisdiction. A list of accepted gas water heater appliance standards are referenced
in Table 44644 501.1¢2). Listed appliances shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s
installation instructions. Unlisted water heaters shall be permitted in accordance with Section
304.3.2.

505.1 Water Heaters. Water heaters deriving heat from fuels or types of cnergy other than gas shall
be constructed and installed in accordance with the approved standards referenced in Sections

S0E.1{2), 505.3, or Scction 505.4. Vents or chimneys for such appliances shall be approved types.
An adequate supply of air for combustion and for adecquate ventilation of heater rooms or
compartments shall be provided. Each such appliance shall be installed in a location approved by
the Authority Having Jurisdiction and local and state firc-prevention agencics.

505.4 Indirect-Fired Water Heaters, [ndircct-fired water heaters shall comply with the applicable
scctions of the ASME Boiler and Pressure Vessel Code, or to onc of the other applicable standards
shown in Fable—d-t Scetion 501.1(2). Each water heater shall bear a label in accordance with
ASME requirements, or an approved testing agency, certifying and attesting that such an appliance
has been tested, inspected and meets the requirements of the applicable standards or code.

Scction 501.1 was revised as the scope of the chapter cncompasses all types of water heaters (ex:
fucl gas-fired, oil-fired, clectric, ete.), including applicable chimney, venting, and conncctor
requircments The third sentence was struck out, but did not negate the requirement for water heaters
to mcet approved standards and be installed in accordance with manufacturer's instructions. Therc is
now a new Table 501.1(b) in this chapter that shows a list of accepted water heater appliance
standards rather than referring to the Referenced Standards. Unlisted water heaters must meet the
clearance requirements of Section 504,3.2.

Where listed water heaters are required, such appliances shall conform to the applicable mandatory
reference standards, and should be listed to assist the end user in identifying water heaters that arc
approved based on material and performance requirements without having to scarch throughout
Table 1701.1. Adding mandatory reference standards to the body of the code was one of the
recommendations that were made to the Technical Committee by the Standards Task Group.

Oil-fired water heaters are to be listed to UL 732, but as required by UL 732 and Scction 503.3,
should be installed in accordance with NFPA 31.

Section 505.1 was also medificd to provide correlation with the applicable non-fucl gas standards
referenced in Scction 501.1 (UL 732, UL 174, or UL [453), Scction 505.3 (NFPA 31), or Scction
505.4 (ASME Boiler and Pressure Vessel Code).

Section 505.4 was revised to provide correlation with the applicable standards referenced in Section
301.1.

18

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



501.1 Applicability,

505.1 Water Heaters, and 505.4 Indirect-Fired Water Heaters {continued)

What It Means
To Me

Water heaters that arc listed comply to referenced standards and arc in compliance only if they arce
installed per the manufacturer’s installation instructions. Duec to the number of different
manufacturers it is imperative that the installation instructions for the particular water heater be
followed. The installer should leave these instructions with the water heater for the home owner and
for the inspector to verify these were heeded.

If the water heater is not installed properly the manufacturer may void any warranty if problems
should arisc from an improper installation. Furthermore, deadly consequences can occur from not
installing the mandatory safety feawres.

Plcasc note that some items are “recommended” by the manufacturer and not necessarily mandatory.
These instructions usually reference that the installer “comply with local code requirements.”

Pressure Vessels nameplates for hot water storage tanks over 120 gallons will contain a "U" symbol
which stands for "Unfired Pressure Vessel" Another symbol you will encounter is "HLW",
where 'L" is inside the top part of "H" in "HLW," and "W" is inside the bottom part of "H" in that
"HLW" symbol. The rules in "Part HLW" of the ASME Codc apply to water heaters and water
storage tanks with corrosion resistance for supplying potable hot water. You will see the "U” symbol
it the nameplate is welded 1o the tank (on the side), and "HLW™ is just a label attached on the side
of the tank.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes

19



505.4.1 Single-Wall Heat Exchanger

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

505.4.1 Single-Wall Heat Exchanger. An lindircct-fired water heater that incorporates a single-

wall heat exchanger shall meet be in accordance with the following requirements:

H—}—Hfﬂeﬂi;‘d—’eﬂ a-tew—pressure-hetwater boHertinted to-a—masimum-of 30-poundstoree-per

settfe-shelgange {paig 200 o e paproved-sadety o relieEvalea

(2D The The Hhcs]trac transfer medium is shall be cither potable water or contains fluids havire-atesieiy
rrtng-er-Class-of-} recognized as safe by the Food and Drug Administration (FDA} as food
grade.

(32) Bear a label with the word “Caution,” followed by the following statements:

(2) The heat-transfer medium shall be potable water or other nontoxic Nuid havirgatesic matineo:
Slassetastisted-in-Clinteal-Toxsieology-of Commercinl-Produets-Sth-aditten recognized as
safe by the FDA.

(b) The maximum operating pressurc of the heat-transtessmedium-cxchanger shall-betimited-to-4
not exceed the maximum operating pressure of 36-psis—207-kPal-by-an-approvedsafeiy ¢
rehiefvabve the potable water supply,

(3) The word “Caution™ and the statcments in letters shall have an uppercase height of not less than
0.120 of an inch (3.048 mm). The vertical spacing between lines of type shall be not less than
0.046 of an inch (1.168 mm). Lowercase Ictters shall be compatible with the uppercase letter
size specification.

This change brings consistency between the Uniform Solar Energy Code (USEC) and the Uniform
Plumbing Code (UPC),

Installers and contractors will be able to be consistent amonyg all single wall heat exchanger systems
whether it be an indircet fired water heater or a hydronic solar installation, Users who are primarily
familiar with the UPC will have to take note that the heat transfer medium must now be considered
safe by the FDA rather than have a toxicity rating of class of 1. Also, the pressure requircment is
now shifted to the maximum operating pressure of the potable water supply rather than the static
30psig. Inspectors will now have to cnsurc pressure testing is done accordingly,

20

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



507.5 Drainage Pan

What Changed 507.43 Drainage Pan. Where a water heater is located in an attic, in or on an attic-ceiting asscmbly,
floor-ceiling assembly, or floor-subfloor assembly where damage results from a leaking water
heater, a watertight pan of corrosion-resistant materials shall be installed bencath the water heater
with not less than %, of an inch (20 mm) diameter drain to an approved location. Such pan shall be
not less than 14 inches {38 mm) in depth,

Why It Changed The previous language did not clearly address installations on an attic-ceiling assembly, floor-
ceiling asscmbly, or floor-subfloor assembly which is the intent of this section of code, and has
caused confusion within the industry in regards to the application and cnforcement of this section.
The depth of the pan is important for ensuring that cnough space is provided for the drain
connection fitting generally located on the side of the pan.

What It Means The addition of the words “in or on an” more clearly defines the need of a safe pan and the intent of
To Me the code to protect structural clements of a building. The addition of language defining the depth of
the safe pan provides clarity to this code section for the code official or installer/contractor.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 21



604.1 Pipe, Tube, and Fittings and 605.9.1 Fittings

What Changed

Why it Changed

What It Means
To Me

604.1 Pipe, Tube, and Fittings. Pipe, wbe, fittings, solvent cements, thread sealants, solders, and
flux used in potable water systems intended to supply drinking water shall be in accordance with the
requirements of NSF 61. Where fittings and valves are made from copper alloys containing more
than 15 percent zinc by weight and arc used in plastic piping systems, they shall be resistant to
dezincification and stress corrosion cracking in accordance with NSF 14,

Materials used in the water supply system, except valves and similar devices, shall be of a like
material, except where otherwise approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

Materials for building water piping and building supply piping shall comply with the applicable
standards referenced in Table 604.1,

605.109.1 Fittings. Fittings for PEX tubing shall comply with the applicable standards referenced in
Table 604.1. PEX tubing in accordance with ASTM F876 shall be marked with the applicable
standard designation for the fittings, specified by the tubing manufacturer for use with the tubing.

Dezincification of yellow brass piping components including various valves has become a significant
problem, with failures documented in various arcas throughout the United States. Water varies from arca
to arca and may be from wells, rivers, lakes, or any number of other sources. The code treats all water
fittings and valves the same,

[t should also be emphasized that the change is applicable for only plastic pipe systems, since that is
the scope of NSF 14, If it is a copper pipe system, the dezincification resistance requirement docs

not apply.

A new standard for copper alloy fittings was included in Table 604.1, ASME B16.51. This standard
allows for copper alloys having a chemical composition containing a minimum of §4% copper and a
maximum of 16% zinc. So if it is a plastic pipc system with copper alloy fittings and valves that
comply with ASME B16.51 in Table 604.1, you will not know with certainty if the zinc content is
less than 16% unless you request a UNS (United Numbering System) for copper and copper alloys
from the manufacturer. The UNS number will be a C Fidigits. The Copper Development
Association provides a full datasheet of UNS numbers for copper and copper alloys with the all the
percentages of chemical compositions.

Itis not practical to treat the water as people drink it and there are already cxtensive Federal repulations
governing its treatment. The solution is to regulate the products through the code. Installers and officials
must ensure installed plastic piping products meet the dezincification requircments by verifying that
approved, listed products that have been rigorously tested are installed.

This code change will be a little tricky to enforce. Brass fittings have a wide range of alloy
variations, so not all brass fittings will nced NSF 4 testing. Typically red brasses will be compliant
whereas yellow brasses will not. There are some silicon brasses and bismuth alloys in brass that
exceed 15% zine, Again, the only way to know if the zinc alloy in the brass fitting exceeds 15% is
1o request a UNS (United Numbcring System) for copper and copper alloys from the manufacturer.
If'the UNS shows the zinc content greater than 15%, than NSF 14 will be required.

A new standard for copper alloy fittings was included in Table 604.1, ASME B16.51. This standard
allows for copper alloys having a chemical composition containing a minimum of 84% copper and a
maximum of 16% zinc. So if it is a plastic pipc system with copper alloy fittings and valves that
comply with ASME B16.51 in Table 604.1, you will not know with certainty if the zinc content is
less than 16% unless you request a UNS (United Numbering System) for copper and copper alloys
from the manufacturcr. The UNS number will be a C+5digits. The Copper Development
Association provides a full datasheet of UNS numbers for copper and copper alloys with the all the
pereentages of chemical compositions.

22

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



604.2 Lead Content

What Changed 604,12 Lead Content, Water pipe-and-fittings-with-a-lead-comentwhich-exceadsS-pereent shab-be
prohibited-in-pipingsysiemsused-to-convey-potable-swater: The maximum allowable lead content in
pipes, pipe fittings, plumbing fittings. and fixtures intended to convey or dispense walter for human
consumption shall be not more than a weighted average_of 0.25 percent with respect to the wetted
surfaces of pipes, pipe fittings, plumbing fittings, and fixtures. For solder and flux, the lead content
shall be not morg than 0.2 percent where used in piping systems that convey or dispense water for
human consumption.

Exceptions:
(1} Pipes, pipe fittings, plumbing fittings. fixtures, or backflow preventers used for nonpotable

water systems.
{(2) Flush valves, fill valves. Qushometer valves, tub fillers. shower valves, service saddles, or water

distribution main gate valves that are 2 inches (30 mm) in diameter or larger.

Why It Changed Section 1417 of the Safe Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 300g-6) was amended by Senate Bill 3874
- 2010 (http://www.gpo.gov/fdsys/pkg/BILLS-111s3874enr/pdf/BILLS-11153874cnr.pdf). This bill
changed the definition of lead frec in the Safe Drinking Water Act from not more than 8 percent lead
to not more than a weighted average of 0.25 pereent. The effective date of the SDWA revision is
January 4, 2014. Furthermore, NSF 372 is the American National Standard for Drinking Water
System Components-Lead Content that indicates how the new requirements are to be determined.

What It Means Instatlers will nced to make surc that when installing potable water
To Me systems for human consumption they are using material (pipe, LOW_LE AD
valves, fittings and fixtures) that comply with the new lead free ]
law. In addition to the matcria! solder and fluxes will need to
comply. Decpending on what type of system they are installing | A
selection of a Nux that is appropriate for a particular icad free alloy P
is critical to soldering success along with being familiar with the M O
different technique needed to solder with the new materials, 1t is R &
highly recommended that installers solder test picees and cut them T
open to determine solder penetration depth.

Inspectors will need to learn how to identify lead free components

by the lead-free certification symbols from the various certification TM
bodics to verify they are being installed in the proper application.

Verification of the proper flux presents a potential verification

problem with the inspector as flux is used in the joining method IAPMO Lead Free
prior to inspections. A tip for inspectors is during all of their Mark of Conformity
inspections be aware of what plumbing material is stored on sight

and maybec take a look in the plumbers soldering tool box.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 23



606.5 Control Valve

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

606.5 Control Valve. A control valve shall be installed immediately ahead of cach water-supplicd
appliance and immediately ahcad of cach slip joint or appliance supply.

Parallel water distribution systems shall provide a control valve cither immediately ahcad of
cach fixture being supplicd or installed at the manifold, and shall be identified with the fixture being
supplied. Where parallel water distribution system manifolds are located in_attics, crawl spaces, or
other locations not readilv accessible a separate shutoff vatve shall be required immediately abead of

cach individual fixture or appliance served.

The 2012 language allowed for the installation of a manifold in an attic or crawl space with no shut-
off valve at the fixtre. This can result in a condition whercas 2 homeowner may develop a leak in a
faucet or supply pipe, and not be able to shut off the water to that fixture or appliance. For cxample,
a lcak develops at the connection of the supply tubing and the faucet. The homeowner observes
water flowing out from under the sink and docs not know that the manifold is located in the attic to
shut the faucet off. This new requirement requires water shut off to the fixture by the control valve
when the manifold shutoff valve is not readily accessible,

Installers and inspectors should remember that, no matter what system is being installed, a readily
accessible means to shut water off to fixturcs is required, whether it is control valves ahcad of
fixtures or valves on a readily accessible manifold.

24

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



608.3 Expansion Tanks and
Combination Temperature and Pressure-Relief Valves

What Changed 608.3 Expansion Tanks, and Combination Pressurer—and-Temperature relieFvalves and
Pressure-Relief Valves. A water system provided with a check valve, backflow preventer, or other
normally closed device that prevents dissipation of building pressure back into the water main,
independent of the type of water_heater used, shall be provided with an approved, lisied, and
adcquately sized cxpansion tank or other approved device having a similar function to control
thermal cxpansion. Such expansion tank or other approved device shall be installed on the building
side of the check valve, backflow preventer, or other device and shall be sized and installed in
accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions.

A water system comtaining storage water heating equipment shall be provided with an
approved, listed, adequately sized combination pressure-and temperature and pressure-rclief valve,
except for listed nonstorage instantancous heaters having an inside diameter of not more than 3
inches (80 mm). Each such approved combination temperature and pressure relief-valve shall be
installed on the water-heating device in an approved location based on its listing requircments and
the manufacturer’s installation instructions. Each such combination temperature and pressure
relief-valve shall be provided with a drain in accordance with Section 608.5.

Why It Changed There is a misunderstanding throughout the industry that, if a tankless water heater is installed, an
cxpansion tank is not nccessary; this is not true except for instantancous heaters having an inside
diameter of not morc than 3-inches. These small units having practically no storage capacity do not
have significant thermal cxpansion. Other than this cxception, the above revision clarifies that,
regardless of the type of watcer heater that is installed, thermal expansion can still occur in the cold
water supply line. Therefore, an approved expansion tank or other approved device nceds to be
installed.

What it Means This language  addition
To Me indicates to the installer and @412z \
inspector that expansion tanks 1 Optional Location

1

anc_l Temperature and Pressure agﬂgg:,;agzgigf tonal F======!
rclieve valves must be —_— A 3 To System —»
installed on cvery type of E { 1~ {
watcr heater that is installed, n T “ 1‘0’;“3 Salaty
except  for  instantancous i Relief Vatve
heaters having an inside H ]/

- diamcter of not more than 3- " Tra
inches. Otherwise, thermal  Optional Localionji__ .
expansion can occur when i ET u ] )
water is heated no matter the Hie o :m Walts Heaterf) &
type of heater used, “ILELE &

Watts Pressura Gauge | g

These  water  heaters  are Water ~ Watis H
protected in three stages. The Supply E?j\’,‘;‘,?f;,
primary  stage is  the
thermostat. 3

Should the thermostat fail, the sccondary stage or highlimit switch will trn off the source of
cnergy to the heater. If the . . .

high-limit switch fails, the Optional Expansion Tank Locations

combination T&P valve opens to prevent a catastrophic failure of the water heater. Instantancous
water heaters having an insidc diameter of three inches or less arc exempt from having a T&P
valve. These small units arc without a storage reservoir, having only a heating coil that does not
allow significant thermal expansion. When the need for hot water has been met the instantancous
water heater shuts off. It docs not cause a great amount of expansion because there is not a large
volume of water 1o heat or expand.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes . 25



608.3 Expansion Tanks and
Combination Temperature and Pressure-Relief Valves (continued)

When installing a T&P valve it is critical that the installer check the rating platc on the combination
T&P valve before installation to make sure that the Btu input rating of the water heater does not
exceed the maximum Btu rating of the valve. The use of an undersized combination T&P valve
could result in a catastrophic water heater failure should both the water heater thermostat and the
water heater high-limit switch fail. In instances where there are two scparate Btu ratings on the
valve plate, the smaller of the two is used in making this determination,

Manufacturers of T&P valves require that the valve be installed with ils temperaturc-sensing
clement immersed within the top 6 inches of the tank since this is where the hottest water in the
tank is located. Manufacturers recommend that they be manually opened at lcast once a year to
ensurc that they are functioning. In arcas that have a high mineral content in the water, scale can
form around the valve scat and render the valve inoperable. In such arcas, it may be necessary to
manually open the valve cvery three months or less. A water heater is a potential bomb that is
prevented from cxploding by three separate safety devices. The combination T&P valve is a
lifesaver and is treated accordingly.

26

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



612.0 Residential Fire Sprinklers

What Changed

Why It Changed

612.0 Residential Fire Sprinkler Systems.

612.1 -Geaeral-Where Regquired. Where residential fre—sprinkler systems are iwail-ed—rhey
required in one and two family dwellings or townhouses. the systems shall be installed by _an
ASSE/IAPMO Series 7000 certified installer in accordance \Vlthmmn&afd##&ﬂ&m—iubh—i-WH—
this scction or NFPA 13D. This_section _shall be considered equivalent to NFPA 13D. Partial
residential sprinkler systems shail_be permitted to be installed in buildings not required to be
equipped with a residential sprinkler system,

612.2 Tvpes of Svstems. This scction shall apply 10 stand-alone and multipurpose wei-pipe sprinkler
systems that do not include the use of antifieeze. A multipurpose fire sprinkler system shall provide
potable water to both fire sprinklers and plumbing fixtures. A stand-alone sprinkler system shall be
separate and independent from the potable water distribution system. A backflow preventer shall not
be required to separate a stand-along sprinkler systemn from the water distribution system where the

sprinkier system material is in accordance with the requirements of Section 604.0.

612.3 Sprinklers. Sprinklers shall be installed in accordance with Section 612.3.1 through Section
612.3.7.

612.3.1 Required Sprinkler Locations. Sprinklers shall be installed to protect all floor arcas of a

dwelling unit in one and two family dwellings or townhouses.

Exceptions:
(1} Attics, crawl spaces, and normally unoccupied_concealed spaces that do not contain fuel-

fired appliances do not reguire sprinklers. In attics, crawl spaces, and normally unoccupied
concealed spaces that contain fuel-fired equipment, a_sprinkler shall be provided to protect the
cquipment; however, sprinklers shall not be required_in the remainder of the space.
{2) Clothes closets, linen closets and pantries that do_not ¢xceed 24 square feet (2.2 m°) in area,
with the smallest dimension not exceeding 3 feet (914 mm) and having wall and ceiling surfaces
of gypsum board.

(3) Bathrooms and toilet rooms not ereater than 53 square feet (5.1 m°) in area.

4y Garages: carports: exterior porches: unheated entrv_arcas. such as mud rooms, that are
adjacent to an exterior door: and similar areas,

{5) Covercd unhcated projections of the building at entrances/exits provided it is not the only
means of egress from the dwelling unit.

(6} Ceiling pockets that meet the following requircments:

a) The total volume of an unprotected ceiling pocket does not exceed 100 cubic feet (2.83
m').

(b} The entire floor under the unprotecied ceiling pocket is protecied by the sprinklers at the
lower ceiling clevation.

(c) Each unprotected ceiling pocket is separated from an adjacent unprotected ceiling pocket
bv not less than a 10 feet (3048 mm) horizontal distance.

d) The interior finish of the unprotected ceiling pocket is noncombustible material.

{¢) Skylights not exceeding 32 square feet (2.97 m’).

Note: This is only a sampling of the changes regarding residential fire sprinklers as they arc very
numerous and not practical to show in this format. Pleasc scc the 2015 UPC Illustrated Training
Manual and the 2015 Uniform Plumbing Code for more information.

Residential sprinklers arc required for all onc- and two- family dwellings and townhouses in the
International Residential Code and International Building Code. These new sections add the
appropriate requirements for residential sprinklers to the UPC. The requirements are consistent with
NFPA 13D and the IRC. Scction 612.1 references ASSE series 7000 which is a standard for certified
installers and inspectors of these systems.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 27



612.0 Residential Fire Sprinklers {continued)

What It Means
To Me

These changes simplify and coordinate differing regulations in one cohesive prescriptive set of
requirements. This can only help different trades using differcnt regulations achicve the same result
and system configuration. By having the requirements in the plumbing code, the plumbing or
sprinkler contractor has access to the design and installation requirements. Having the requircments,
and not refercnces to other codes and standards, simplifies the requircment by having the prescriptive
requirements that are consistent with NFPA 13D and the IRC Plumbing section. Given that these
requirements are new to the UPC, the inspector will have to ensure that these requirements are being
applicd and installations comply with all subscctions.

This addition provides the installers, inspectors and others a qualification and an ANSI approved
certification by a third party to reference for installation and certification for installers of these
systems in the above listed dwellings. As the raie of residential fire sprinkler systems installed
continucs to increase, it will be vital that any installer wishing to do this type of work carn the ASSE
7000 certification. Failurc to do so can result in cither not being sclected for such work or the system
being rejected by the AHJ if it is discovered the system was installed by non-certified personnel. It
would be advised that certified individuals keep their certification card on them to prove their
certification if it is called into question.

Inspectors should be vigilant in verifying that the individuals that install residential sprinkler systems
arc indeed certified to the ASSE 7000 standard. When in doubt, the inspector should seck proof from
the contractor demonstrating that they were in compliance with this new language.

Section 216.1 references ASSE series 7000 which is a standard for certified installers and inspectors
of these systems,

ASSE Intarnalienal

Professional Qualications Standard lor
Residential Potable
Water Fire Protection
System Installers &
Inspectors for One and
Two Family Dwellings

Aw Amerscan National Stawdirad

[mage Courtesy of ASSE International

28

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



707.4 Location

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

707.4 Location. Each horizontal drainage pipe shall be provided with a clecanout at its upper
terminal, and cach run of piping, that is more than 100 feet (30 480 mm) in total developed length,
shall be provided with a cleanout for cach 100 feet (30 480 mm), or fraction thercof, in length of
such piping. An additional clcanout shall be provided in a drainage line for cach aggregate
horizontal change of dircction cxceeding 135 degrees (2.36 rad). A cleanout shall be installed above
the fixture connection fitting, serving each wrinal, regardless of the location of the urinal in the

building.

Exceptions:

(1) & (2) {remaining text unchanged)

(3) Excepting the building drain, aad its horizontal branches, and urinals, a clcanout shall not be
required on a pipe or piping that is above the floor level of the lowest floor of the building,

(4) (remaining text unchanged)

Regardless of the location of the urinal in a building there continues to be a problem of stoppages
immediately downstream of the fixture connection fitting outlet. Using a “urinal auger™ has limited
cffect and range for thoroughly cleaning the urinal drain lines. This condition has been cxasperated
with the smaller diameter trap area of the “high cfficiency urinals,” and/or “waterless urinals.”

Removing the urinal from the wall has been necessary for most mechanical cleaning of the vertical
and horizontal urinal drains. Installing a cleanout above the fixture connection fitting serving cach
urinal will provide access for mechanically cleaning the drain line without having to remove the
urinal from the wall. A code required cleanout installed above the fixture connection fitting of the
urinal cxpedites cleaning of the drain lines and is less inconvenient to who purchased and must
maintain those fixtures. An accessible cleanout will also promote ongoing preventative maintenance
of the urinal drain system.

The installer must provide a cleanout above cach urinal on installation. This cleanout will serve for
clearing the drain or routine maintenance of the urinal. Despite this new code section, routine
maintenance is still required. The owner should be aware that they have not been excused from this
responsibility. The routine maintenance will also serve to cut down on the interruption of use by a
blockage. Inspectors will need to ensure that a cleanout is provided for cach urinal and at the upper
terminal of the horizontal pipe serving the urinals.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 29



707.9 Clearance

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

707.9 Ciearance. Each cleanout in piping 2 inches (50 mm) or less in size shall be so installed that
there is a clearance of not less than 42 1§ inches (365 457 mm) in front of the cleanout, Cleanouts in
piping cxcceding 2 inches (50 mm) shall have a clearance of not less than 48 24 inches (457 610
mm) in front of the cleanout. Cleanouts in under-floor piping shall be extended to or above the
finished floor or shall be extended outside the building where there is less than (8 inches (457 mm)
vertical overall, allowing for obstructions such as ducts, beams, and piping, and 30 inches of (762
mm) horizontal clearance from the means of access to such cleanout. No under-floor cleanout shall
be located exceeding 20 5 feet (6096 1524 mm) from an access door, trap door, or crawl hole.

Having a rcquirement for additional access clearance for cleanouts will enable clean outs to be
utilized without risking damage to the surroundings. Additional clearances will also casc the usc of
sewer cleaning machines which cannot be casily utilized in crawl spaces. In addition, cleanouts
farther than 5 feet from access openings are difficult to open and utilize to clear stoppages in sewer
and building drains.

This code change allows for additional clearance for the use of sewer cleaning machines and in
requiring cleanouts to be closer 10 aceess points will case the use of sewer cleaning machines for
clearing stoppages in below floor plumbing systems, The above clearances are for the benefit of the
service plumber. They allow enough room for a repair to be completed without too much disruption
to the occupants in the building and so the job can be done quickly and cfficiently,

30

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



710.4 Discharge Line

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

710.4 Discharge Line., The discharge line from such cjector, pump, or other mechanical device
shall be of approved pressure rated material and be provided with an accessible backwater or swing
check valve and gate or ball valve. Where the gravity drainage line to which such discharge linc
conncets is horizontal, the method of connection shall be from the top through a wye branch fitting.
The gate or ball valve shall be located on the discharge side of the backwater or check valve.

Gate or ball valves, where installed in drainage piping, shall be fullway type with working parts of
corrosion-resistant metal. Sizes 4 inches (100 mm) or more in diameter shail have cast-iron bodics,
and sizes Icss than 4 inches (100 mm), cast-iron or brass copper allov bodies.

The UPC now requires pressure rated fittings and material for discharge lines. This had not been
addressed in the past, and will allow for case in application and enforcement.

Installers and inspectors now have a ciear understanding that pressure fittings must be used on
discharge lines and arc now responsible for ensuring they arc installed where necessary. The
inspeetor and installer should examine the material to be uscd to verify that it is indeed an approved
pressure rated material. In the event of a blockage in the sewer system downstrcam of the pump
discharge, a positive pressure situation could arise. The addition of pressurc rated fittings alleviates
the risk of breakage do to this pressurc.

More specifically, the inspector will need to know the meaning of the standards marking on the
pipe. For example, an inspector noting that the piping is marked, “ASTM F 891 Cocxtruded Cellular
Core PVC Pipe” will nced to know that particular pipe is for non-pressure usc only.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 31



814.0 Condensate Wastes and Disposal

What Changed

814.0 Condensate Wastes and Disposal.

814.1 Condensate Disposal. Condensate from air washers, air-cooling coils, fuelbumine
condensing appliances, and the overflow from evaporative coolers; and similar water supplied
cquipment or similar air-conditioning equipment shall be collected and discharged to an approved
plumbing fixture or disposal arca. Where discharged into the drainage system, cquipment shall drain
by mcans of an indircct waste pipe. The waste pipe shall have a slope of not less than ' inch per
foot (10.4 mm/m) or 1 percent slope and shall be of approved corrosion-resistant material not
smaller than the outlet size in accordance with Table Scciion 814.43 or Section 814.4 for air-cooling
coils or condensing fuel-burning appliances, respectively. Condensate or wastewater shall not drain
over a public way.

814.1.1 Condensate Pumps. Where approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction, condensate
pumps_shall be installed in_accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions. Pump
discharge shall rise vertically 1o a point wherc it is possible to connect to a gravity condensate drain
and _discharged to an approved disposal point. Each condensing unit shall be provided with a
separate sump and interlocked with the equipment to prevent the egquipment from operating during
fatlure. Scparate pumps shall be permitied to_conncet to a single gravity indirect waste where
equipped with check valves and approved by the Authority Havine Jurisdiction.

814.2 Condensate Control. Where an equipment or appliance is installed in a space where damage
is_ capable of resulting from condensate overflow, other than damage to replaceable lay-in_ceiling
tiles, a_drain line shall be provided and shall be drained in accordance with Section 814.1. An
additional protection method for condensate overflow shall be provided in accordance with one of

(1) A water level detecting device that will shut off the equipment or appliance in the event the
primary grain is blocked.

(2) An_additional watertight_pan of corrosion-resistant material, with_a separate drain linc,
installed beneath the cooling ceil, unit, or the appliance to catch the overflow condensate
due to a clogged primary condensate drain.

(3) An additional drain line at a level that is higher than the primary drain_linc connection of
the drain pan,

(4) An_additional watertight pan of corrosion-resistant material with a water level detection
device installed beneath_the cooling coil, unit. or the appliance to catch the overflow
condensate due to a clogeed primary condensate drain and to shut off the eguipment,

The additional pan or the additional drain line connection shall be provided with a drain pipe of
not_less than 34 of an_inch (20 mm) nominal pipe size. discharging at a_point that is readily
observed.

814.2.1 Protection of Appurtenances. Where insulation or appurtenances are installed where
damage is capable of resulting trom a_condensate drain_pan overfill, such installations shall oceur
above the rim of the drain pan with supports. Where the supports are in contact with the condensate
waste, the supports are in contact with_the condensate waste, the supports shall be of approved
corrosion-resistant material.

814.23 Condensate Waste Pipe Materin) and Sizeing. Condensate waste pipes from air-cooling
coils shall be sized in accordance with the equipment capacity as specified in Table 814.3. The
material ot the piping shall comply with the pressure and temperature rating of the  appliance or

equipment, and shall be approved for use with the liguid being discharsed.

32

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



814.0 Condensate Wastes and Disposal {continued)

Why It Changed

TABLE 81413
MININMUM CONDENSATE PIPE SIZE

EQUIPMENT CAPACITY IN
TONS OF REFRIGERATION

MINIMUM CONDENSATE
PIPE DIAMETER
({nches)

Up to 20

3

21 =40

41 -90

14

91=-125

ths

126 - 250

i

For SLunits: | ton of refmeerant = 3.52 kW, 1 inch = 25 mm

The size of condensate waste pipes is for one unit or a combination of units, or as rccommended
by the manufacturer. The capacity of waste pipes assumes a 4 inch per foot (10.4 mm/m) or 1
percent slope, with the pipe running three-quarters full at the following pipe conditions:

{(remaining text unchanged)

814.3.1 Cleanouts. Condensate drain lines shall be configured or provided with a clganout to permit
the clearing of blockages and for maintenance without requiring the drain line to be cut.

814.4 Appliance_Condensate Drains. Condensate drain_lincs from individual fuel-burning
condensing appliances shall be sized as required by the manufacturer’s instructions. Condensate
drain lines serving more than one appliance shall be approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction

prior to installation.

814.35 Point of Discharge. Air-conditioning condensate wasic pipes shall conncct indirectly,
except where permitied in Section 814.6, to the drainage system through an air gap or air break to
preperty trapped and vented receptors, dry wells, leach pits, or the tailpicce of plumbing fixturcs.

A Econdensatc waste-shall-net drain ever-a-publieway-shall be trapped in accordance with the
appliance manufacturer’s instructions or as approved.

814.6 Condensate Waste From Air-Conditioning Coils. Where the condensate waste from air-
conditioning_coils discharges by_direct_connection to a lavatory_tailpicce or to an approved
accessible inlet on a bathtub overflow. the connection shall be located in the area controiled by the
same person controlling the air-conditioned space.

814.7 Plastic Fittings. Female plastic screwed fittings shall be used with plastic male fittings and
plastic threads.

Sections 814.1 and 814.3 were modified to correlate with Sections 312.1 and 312.3 of the UMC.
Scctions 814.2, 814.4, and 814.6 were added since provisions for air cooling coils, fuel-burning
condensing appliances, and similar water-supplicd equipment arc addressed in the UPC, and
therefore relevant condensate waste provisions should be included as well. These additions correlate
the UPC with the UMC. The text “condensate wastc shall not drain over a public way” was deleted
from Scction 814.5 of the UPC since similar provisions arc alrcady addressed in Scction 814.1, and
thercfore arc redundant.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 33



814.0 Condensate Wastes and Disposal (continued)

What It Means This code scction was added to corrclate with the Uniform Mechanical Code. The inspector will
To Me need to verify the overflow pan and the condensate discharge termination point to the unit that
controls the equipment or other approved locations.

When appliances or equipment that produce condensate are located in a space where damage may
result from a blocked primary condensate drain, an overflow or secondary drain must be provided
in accordance with Section 814.1. In addition, a sccondary mcans of protection for condensate
overflow must be provided in accordance to onc of the four methods provided in Scction 814.2,

The pan is required to prevent any damage that could occur in a concealed location, A small leak
could cause significant damage over time without the occupant’s knowledge. If multiple units are
tied together on a high rise and discharge 1o the first floor fixturc the first floor unit owner will have
difficulty in changing their fixture out while the upper units are discharging condensate waste.

WL

S o S

Condensate Waste Dispal

34 2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



906.3 Use of Roof

What Changed 906.3 Use of Roof. Vent pipes shall be extended separately or combined, of full required size, not
less than 6 inches (152 mm) above the roof or fire wall. Flagpoling of vents shall be prohibited
except where the roof is used for assembly purposes ether-thun—weather—preteeton or_parking.
Vents within 10 feet (3048 mm) of a part of the roof that is used for sueh-sther asscmbly purposcs
or parking shall extend not less than 7 feet (2134 mm) above such roof and shall be sccurcly stayed.

Why It Changed The text “purposes other than weather protection™ does not clearty address the intent of this section
as it could be misinterpreted to include roofs that arc used for equipment installation only. The
intent of this scction is where a roof arca is used for asscmbly purposcs (ex: promenade, sunbathing,
observation deck, ctc.), vents located adjacent to such an arca should be installed not less than 7 feet
above the roof to prevent harmful sewer gases from polluting the occupicd area.

Roofs used for parking purposes arc not intended for “assembly purposes.” However, they need to
be treated in the same manner to protect people from exposure 10 SCWer gascs.

What It Means By dcfining the use of a roof deck, it will help the installer and inspector determine the height of the

To Me vent termination. The user of the roof will not only be proteeted when necessary but it may reduce
the height of the vent which may have csthetic valuc. Installers and the Autherity Having
Jurisdiction may need to come to some agreement, in some cases, where the roof surface is located.
For example, if the roof is being used for certain types of assembly use, there may also be raised
roof arcas, platforms, or additional decking. Defining whether vents must be measured from the
surface of the roof assembly or the bighest installed flooring arca on the roof will be necessary.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 35



4

908.2 Horizontal Wet Venting for a Bathroom Group

What Changed

908.2 Horizontal Wet Venting for a Bathroom Groups. MWaterclosets, bathiubs—showers—und
Aeer-drainswithin-one-ortiwo-bathrosm-sroupslocated-onthesame Hoorlevel and-for privatetise
shith-be-permitied-te-bevented-by-a-wetvent—The-wet-ventshal-be-considered-the—ventforthe
Frtures-and-shall-extendfrom-the-connection-oithe-drevent-alonsthe dirceton-of theHew—inthe
drain-pipe-to-the-mest-dewnstream—fxtuse drain-orrap arm-connectionto-the—horizontal-beaneh
drti—Each-wei-vented fixwre-drain-orteap-arm—shali-connectindependently—to—the wetventad
herzontsh branch-drsin—Lach-mdividual-fxiure desin-or-trap-arm-—shallconnect-horizontallyte-the
wet-vened-horzontal-branch-drain-or-shall-be provided-with-a-drevest The trap-to vent-distance
shith—be—in-sceordancewith-Table 1022 Onlythefistures—within—the bathroom-sreups—shall
conpeci-to-the wel-vented—horizontal-branch-—drain—The—water—eloset fixturedrain-—or-trap-arm
MMMWWi%W&H—Mﬂ%%
Additionalfiniures—shatl-diseharge—downsiream—olthe—wei—vent—systenund-be—conventionally
vepted—A bathroom group located on_the same floor level shall be permitied to be vented by 2
horizontal wet vent where all of the conditions of Section 908.2. | throush Section 908.2.5 are met,

908.2.1 Vent Connection. The dry yent connection.to.theawet vent shall be.an.individualavent. 8

Why It Changed

commenvent-for the levatese—usinal; bidet, shower, or bathtub. Onc or two vented lavatorv(s) shall
be permitted to serve as a wet vent for a bathroom group. Only one wet-vented fixture drain or trap
arm shall discharge upstream of the dry-vented fixture drain connection. Dry vent connections to the
horizontal wet vent shall be in accordance with Section 905.2 and Scction 905.3.

908.2.2 Size. The wet vent shall be sized based on the fixture unit discharge into the wet vent. The
wet vent shalt be not less than 2 inches (50 mm) in diameter for 4 drainage fixture units (dfu) or
less, and not less than 3 inches (80 mm) in diameter for 5 dfu or more, The dry vent shall be sized in
accordance with Table 702.1 and Table 703.2 basced on the total fixtures units discharging into the
wel vent,

908.2.3 Trap Arm, The length of the trap arm shall not exceed the Fmits in Table 10022 The trap size
shall be in accordance with Section 1003.3. The vent pipe_opening from the horizontal wer vent,
exeepl lor water closets and similar fixtures, shall not be below the weir of the trap.

908.2.4 Water Closet. The water closet fixture drain or trap arm _connection to the wet vent shall
be downstream of fixture drain or trap arm conncctions to the horizontal wet vent.

908.2.5 Additiena] Fixtures, Additional fixtures shall discharge downstream of the wet vent system
and be conventionally vented. Only the fixtures within the bathroom group shall connect to the wet-
vented horizontal branch.

204.0
Bathroom. A room equipped with a shower, buthtub, or combination bath/shower.

Bathroom Group. A—greup-Any combination of fixtures-eensistingef4 , not to cxeeed one waler
closct, ere-ar two lavatorics,-asd cither & one bathtub: & or onc combination bath/shower, e and
one shower, and may include a usimal-of bidet and an ¢emergency floor drain.

206.0
Dry Vent. A vent that does not receive the discharge of any sewage or wasle.

The previous code Iang,uagc implicd, by the absence of language to the contrary, that an unvented
lavatory may be utilized in a horizontally wet vented system. This would allow an unvented
lavatory 1o conneet independently to the wet vented horizontal branch as long as the distance of the
lavatory trap arm to the wet vented horizontal branch is in accordance with Table 1002.2. This

36

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



908.2 Horizontal Wet Venting for a Bathroom Group {continued)

What It Means
To Me

would allow the lavatory trap arm to form an S-trap, which is in conflict with Section 1004.1 that
prohibits S-traps. The revision has further added a factor of safety to prevent siphonage or self-
siphonage of fixtures by limiting the number of bathroom groups to onc on a horizontal wet vent,
and by limiting the number of fixtures allowed on a horizontal wet vent. Therefore, the committec
revised the definition of bathroom group to reflect this factor of safety.

The change in the definition of a Bathroom Group further clarifies what type and the number of
fixturcs that are allowed to be utilized in a horizontal wet vent installation, in addition the change in
the definition of a Bathroom Group changes the usc of horizontally wet vented systems from two (2)
bathrooms to one (1) bathroom. This is a significant change from the previous interprelation;
however this change does clear up the question of how a water closet (WC) can be the lowest fixture
in a group with two water closets (WC),

When horizontal wet venting first came into the UPC, it proved to be very controversial as many did
not understand the code language and were concerned that these systems would not function as
intended. To address this, IAPMO convened an ad hoc committee to review the language and this
resulted in a Tentative Interim Amendment (TIA). This TIA served as the basis for the new 2015
language in this section, which greatly clarifics these issucs. Code users need to cnsurc they are
familiar with the new language. They should also be aware of the new definitions that apply to these
systems since much of the previous confusion was related to unclear definitions. Some of the carly
hesitation regarding the admitiance of horizontal wet vent was concern of the proper function of
these systems. Installing them in a manner that is not compliant with thesc sections can lead to the
siphonage of the traps, leading to sewer gas being allowed into the structure. Stoppages resulting in
flooding could also occur.

— 2" Vent

H .
P
1-1/2 —\
112 — LAlv — 2 Wet Vent
b 1L/
TUB \f\ /
£ ( |

Wet Vent Section 5
Of Piping System L A |

6 DFUs

Horizontal Wet Vent Diagram
Image Courtesy of ASPE

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 37



911.0 Circuit Venting

What Changed

Why It Changed

C-8911.0 Circuit Venting.

€-8211.1 Circuit Vent Permitted. Cireui—venting shall-be-designed-by—a-resistored-professional
ergHeerta-ensifeereddesizn A maximum of eight fixtures connccted to a horizontal branch
drain shall be permitted to be circuit vented. Each fixture drain shall connect horizontally to the
horizontal branch being circuit vented. The horizontal branch drain shall be classified as a vent from
the most downstream fixture drain connection 1o the most upstrcam fixture drain connection to the
horizontal branch.

E—8911.1.1 Multiple Circuit-Vented Branches. Circuit-vented horizontal branch drains are
permitted to be conncected together. Each group of a maximum of cight fixtures shall be considered a
separate circuit vent and shall be in accordance with the requirements of this scction.

€-8211.2 Vent Size and Connection. The circuit vent shall be not less than 2 inches (50 mm) in
diameter and the conncction shall be located between the two most upstream fixture drains. The vent
shall connect to the horizontal branch on the vertical. The circuit vent pipe shall not receive the
discharge of a soil or waste,

£-8911.3 Slope and Size of Horizontal Branch. The maximum slope of the vent section of the
horizontal branch drain shall be pot more than 1 inch per foot (83.3 mm/m). The eatirc length of the
vented scction of the horizontal branch drain shall be sized for the total drainage discharge to the
branch.

€-8911.3.1 Size of Multiple Circuit Vent. Multiple circuit vented branches shall be permitted to
conncct on the same floor level. Each separate circuit-vented horizontal branch that is
interconnected shall be sized independently in accordance with Section €%911.3. The downstream
circuit-vented horizontal branch shall be sized for the total discharge into the branch, including the
upstream branches and the fixtures within the branch.

€821 1.4 Reliel Vent. A 2 inch (50 mm) relicf vent shall be provided for circuit-vented horizontal
branches receiving the discharge of four or more water closets and connecting to a drainage stack
that reccives the discharge of soil or waste from upper horizontal branches.

€-8911.4.1 Connection and Installation. The relief vent shall connect to the horizontal branch
drain between the stack and the most downstream fixture drain of the circuit vent, The relicf vent
shall be installed on the vertical to the horizontal branch.

€-8911.4.2 Fixture Drain or Branch. The rclicf vent is permitted to be a fixture drain or fixture
branch for a fixture located within the same branch interval as the circuit-vented horizontal branch.
The discharge to a relief vent shall not cxceed 4 fixture units,

&-89311.5 Additional Fixtures. Fixturcs, other than the circuit-vented fixturcs, are permitted to
discharge to the horizontal branch drain. Such fixtures shall be located on the same foor as the
circuit-vented fixtures and shall be cither individually or common vented.

These changes relocate the circuit venting requircments of Appendix C to Chapter 9 with all of the
other venting methods, so that provisions that have been proven to safeguard public health can be
applicd and enforced. In Section 911.1 (Circuit Vent Permitted), the text “circuit venting shall be
designed by a registered professional engineer as an engincered design™ was deleted as the text
alrcady provided prescriptive language for the sale installation of such a system without the need for
an engincer. Furthermore, the code language prescriptively describes the installation of circuit
venting similar to other code sections which describe the installation of wet venting or combination
wasle and venting mcthods that already have provisions located within the body of the code without
being required to be designed by an engincer.

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



911.0 Circuit Venting (continued)

What It Means
To Me

The addition of Circuit venting provides another installation method to install multiple fixtures in
residential and commerceial construction that will save labor and materials. This system has been
widely used and allowed in many jurisdictions. The addition of this method to the body of the code
would assure wider adoption that for it to remain in the appendices, which must be adopted
selectively by jurisdictions.

Circuit venting has been a common venting practice used in plumbing in the United States since the
1920s. Dr. Hunter included circuit venting in the Plumbing Manual BMS 66 published in 1940, By
this time, circuit venting had become widely accepted and recognized throughout the United Statcs,
Circuit venting is an effective and efficient method of venting a battery of fixtures connccied to a
horizontal branch. Without the turbulent action of a vertical stack, maintaining the pressure within a
herizontal branch becomes less demanding. The vent for a circuit vent is typically 2 inch in diameter
providing morc than an adequate amount of air for venting the battery of fixturcs. One vent for
cvery 8 fixtures is all that is required to maintain the pressure within the branch to plus or minus |
inch of a water column.

Horizontal batteries of fixtures may be vented with a circuit vent. The horizontal branch may serve a
mixture of two to eight water closets, floor drains, bathtubs and shower stalls. The entire length of
the horizontal branch drain must be sized for the total drainage fixture load for the branch.

There arc two conditions that mandate the installation of a relief vent for a circuit-vented horizontal
branch: I) when the circuit-vented horizontal branch receives the discharge of four or more water
closets, and 2) when the circuit-vented horizontal branch connects to a stack that receives discharges
from upper Aoor fixtures.

i T i _— 2 Rellef Vent
co fa™
s Pr L
we L~ e "~ Fixtures Cannecting
we L7 .'H'“:h, i On Upper Floors
we L~ -
- # P b | .
rr Pt we L - . ‘
J we L~ L

Circuit Venting
Image Courtesy of ASPE

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 39



1009.1 Where Required

What Changed 1009.1 Where Required. Interceptors (clarifiers) (including grease, oil, sand, solid interceptors
felartfiess], cic.) shall be required by the Authority Having Jurisdiction where they are necessary for
the proper handling of liquid wastes containing grease, flammable wastes, sand, solids, acid or
alkaline substances, or other ingredients harmful to the building drainage system, the public or
private scwer, or to public or private sewage disposal.

Why It Changed In addition to grease, oil and sand, interceptors arc also commonly used to prevent solids from
entering the drainage system. Solids can include glass particles, hair, sand, cte. The addition of the
word “solid” brings this 10 light.

What It Means There has been an increase in the number of interceptors being produced that can properly handle
To Me solids and an increasc in their use has been noticed. The determination of the requirement for an
interceptor will be identified during the code review process. Inspectors will have to verify that an

intereeplordesigned.to hundle.solids.is.presentifitis decmed.necessany. . Installers. must b awiarc.o  m—

this requirement early on in the construction process. Failure to install an interceptor can result in
damage to the sewage system and increased liability to the installer and/or contractor.

Endura Solids Interceptor

The solids mterceptor has two removable sereens, the L5t that separates coarse matenal (¢, followed by a finer scroen for smaller debns 2)
These have mew'ded details L ensure they are fitedin the cgrrect locatian ane have flew direciicn amows moulded unto the top surface (6) The
cearse screen (large openng 3) 13 2hwoys located upsiream {sink sw2) of 1he fne screen {small openirgs)

The solids coriainer inzorporates the outlet alang tne bottam deamsire am edge and recirculates e flow upward and alongside the basket

,-)(!éndyra
Solids
Interceptor

Course Dekris Screen
3 Fine Detris Sereen
@ 5cics Baskel

[T vt

B3 outier

[ Oder Sea
E[E Eazy Open Laiches

It is highly recommended that a solids interceptor be used In conjunction with the grease interceptor, especially when a
faod grinder is discharging Inte the drain line, A solids intsrcaptor will halp prevent the grease Intarceptor from
becoming piugged and will help greatly to maintain its affectiveness.

Sample Solids Interceptor
Image Courtesy of Canplas Plumbing

40 2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



1208.5.9.2, 1208.7, and 1212.5 Gas Joints, Pressure Regulators, and Valves

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

1208.5.9.2 Heat-Fusion Joint. Heat-fusion joinis shall be made in accordance with AMS-B24

qualified procedures that have been established and proven by _1est to produce gastight joints_as

strong_as the pipe or tubing being joined. Joints shall be made with the joining method
recommended by the pipe manufacturer. Heat-fusion fittings shall be marked “ASTM D 2513."

[NFPA 54:5.6.9(2)]

1208.7 Gas Pressure Regulators. A line gas pressure regulator or gas appliance pressure regulator,
as_applicable, shall be installed where the gas supply pressure exceeds that at which the branch
supply line or appliances is arc designed to operate or waries vary beyond design pressure limits.
[NFPA 54-12:5.8.1]

12142.5 Appliance Shutoff Valves and Connections. Appliances connceted 1o a piping system
shall have an accessible, approved manual shutoff valve with a nondisplaceable valve member, or a
listed gas convenicnce outlet. Appliance shutoff valves and convenience outlets shall serve a single
appliance and shall be installed within 6 feet (1829 mm) of the appliance it serves. Where a
connector is used, the valve shall be installed upstream of the connector. A union or flanged
connection shall be provided downstream from #hs the valve to permit removal of appliance
controls. Shutoff valves serving decorative gas appliances shall be permitied to be installed in
fireplaces where listed for such usc. [NFPA 54:9.6.4, 9.6.4.1]

These sections within Chapter 12 of the UPC have been revised to correlate with NFPA 54-2012 in
accordance with IAPMO’s Regulations Governing Committee Projects (Extract Guidelines), and the
UMC.

Heat fusion joints being performed by installers will no longer look to the American Welding
Socicty joining procedures but rely only on the manufactures qualified procedures that have been
established and proven by test to produce gastight joints as strong as the pipe or tubing being joincd.
Installers familiar with the previously accepted practice must ensure they arc using the qualified
procedures to avoid piping failures and hazardous situations.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 41



1212.8 Sediment Trap

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

12142.8 Sediment Trap, Wherc a sediment trap is not incorporated as a part of the appliance, a
sediment trap shall be installed downstream of the appliance shutoft valve as close to the inlet of the
appliance as practical, but before the flex connector, where used at the time of appliance installation.
The scdiment trap shall be cither a tee fitting with a capped nipple in the bottom outlet, as illustrated
in Figure 12142.8, or other device recognized as an cffective sediment trap. [lluminating appliances,
ranges, clothes dryers, decorative appliances for installation in vented fireplaces, gas fireplaces, and
outdoor grills shall not be required to be so cquipped. PNERA-54:0.6.7)

This code section was added to clarify the language referring to sediment trap placement.
Downstream of the shut-off and as close as practical to the appliance would not mean afier the flex
conncctor due to the sediment resting in the corrugated appliance connector before it had a chance to
settle into the sediment trap. This would mean the entire connector would need to be replaced. By
placing the drip leg prior to the connector the sediment can scttle into the bottom of the tee and
actually be removed or serviced,

First, the inspector and installer should cnsure that a sediment trap is installed. Although the general
requircment for a sediment trap is not new, it is often observed that they are not installed cven
though the code and many manufacturers require them. This is especially truc in new residential
construction. The gas coming from the utilitics is usually acceptably clean, but there arc other
things that make scdiment traps a necessary safeguard. Often, debris makes its way into the piping
prior to installation whether it is from small debris on the job site or even insects making their way
into the tubing. Scdiment traps are there to prevent this debris from clogging the orifice,

Placing the sediment trap according to the new language helps maximize the protective nature of the
trap by putting it in the optimal focation in the system. Inspectors and installers need to verify that
the sediment is properly located. Otherwise, the potential for sediment to get into the appliance and
causc damage is increased.

Gas supply inlet

1

To -
equipment -—— -— Tee fitting
inlet

Nipple — 3 inch
minimum

Cap —»| ]

Method of Installing a Tee Fitting Sediment Trap

42

2015 Uniferm Plumbing Code®



1303.8 Water Supply for Hospitals

What Changed

Why 1t Changed

What 1t Means
To Me

1303.8 Water Supply for Hospitals. Hospitals shail be provided with not less than two approved
potable water sources that are_instalied in such_a_manncr as to prevent the interruption of water
service.

Sources of potable water, such as a building supply linc and emergency potable water tank(s) nced
to be provided for hospitals as approved by the AHJ. If there is a failure with the water main or
building supply, the hospital would still have onc source of potable water for patient care. This
language is also consistent with provisions found in the Centers for Discase Control and
Prevention’s (CDC), “Emergency Water Supply Planning Guide for Hospitals and Health Care
Facilities.”

Designers, engincers and installers will need to be ready to make provisions for pressure
fluctuations between a pressure system and emergency reservoir tank gravity system. Measures will
need to be in place to assure proper pressure is being delivered to all fixtures regardless of what
system is online. Protecting the potable water serving the care facility should always be the priority
and proper backflow prevention devices must be installed in cach system.

Emergency Water Supply Planning Guide
for Hospitals and Health Care Facilities

gE=m A

Image Courtesy of the Centers for Disease Control

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 43



1501.2 System Design

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

16301.2 System Design. Altcrnate water source systems shall be designed in accordance with this
chapler shali-be-desianed by a pessen registered erHeensed-to-perform-plumbing dosign week
professional or who demonstrates competency to desiyn the alternate water source system as required
by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. Components, piping, and fittings uscd in an alternate water
source system shall be listed.

Exceptions:

H-A-person—reaisiered-ar Heensed to-perform-plumbingdesisnwerk s not Feiired—te- desian
rrwalercatchment-systoms—tised-forimigation-with-a-masimm storge-capaeiy-of 360-satons
HEGL L

H-A-personrtesistered-orticensed to-perfer-plumbingdesien wark—snot-required—to-desian
o2 T —eutehment—systemsfor—sinsle Ry —dwellipas—where —BtHets—piptns—and—system
componentsaretocated-onthe exterior-ofthe buldine

(31) A persen regisicred er-leersed-to perform-plumbing-designwesk professional is not required to
design gray water systcms having a maximum discharge capacity of 250 gallons per day (gal/d)
{0.011 L/s) for single family and multi-family dwellings.

to design an on-site treated nonpotable water system for single family dwellings having a maximum
discharge capacity of 250 gal/d (0.011 L/s).

42) A persen registered erhieensed-to-perfors plumbs design sraek professional.is.notrequired
A32) A persen rogi perti

In 1501.2, the new language gives the AHJ authority to determine the competency of person(s)
authorized 1o design aliernate water systems in accordance with this chapter. This change was
brought about to incorporate and consolidatc language from the IAPMO Green Plumbing and
Mechanical Code Supplement (GPMCS),

It should be noted that the information deleted from this scctions was moved to Chapter 16 which
discusses the rainwater catchment provisions,

Most jurisdictions will allow landscape architects 1o design the downstream side of gray water
systems (afier alicrations to the existing plumbing system). They have a thorough understanding of
soil types, root zones of specific plants, crosion control, and are one of the professional categorics
to become SWPPP (Storm Water Pollution Prevention Plan devcelopers and practitioners). This type
of expertise is required to prevent gray water from ponding and runoff potential.

Many gray water systems are very simple, often gravity based with no tanks or pumps. Even the
small pumped and filtered manufactured type gray water systems are very simple to install, and can
be installed in just a few hours. IF the system has larger volumes of water, or is from commercial
buildings, a licensed person would be required to design the system,

Since there currently is not an accreditation for the design of these systems, standards exist to follow,
ctvil engincers with training in watershed/storm water and or rainwater collection and Storm water
Pollution Prevention Plans, as well as NPDES, and ground water may be qualified, but without an
accreditation program the language leaves open a hole where jurisdictions will be argued with over
the scction. Potential advice is to create an accreditation program.

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



1501.11 Inspection and Testing

What Changed

165031.11 Inspection and Testing. Reelaimed-{reeyeled) Altcrnate water source systems shall be
inspected and tested in accordance with Section 163021.11.1 and Scction 163021.11.2.

163031.11.1 Supply System Inspection and Test. Reelaimed—{reeyeled) Alicrnate water source
systems shall be inspected and tested in accordance with this code for testing of potable water

piping.

165031.11.2 Annual Cross-Conncction Inspection and Testing. An initial and subscquent annual
inspection and test shall be performed on both the potable and reclaimed-treeveled) alicrnate water
source systems, The potable and reelaimed-{reeyeted) altcrnale water source system shall be isolated
from cach other and independently inspected and tested 1o ensure there is no cross-connection in
accordance with Scction 145021.11.2.1 through Scction 165031.11.2.4.

165031.11.2.1 Visual System Inspection. Prior to commencing the cross-connection testing, a dual
system inspection shail be conducted by the Authority Having Jurisdiction and other authoritics
having jurisdiction as follows:

(1) Mcter locations of the reclatmed-{reeyeted) alicrnate water source and potable water lines shall
be checked to verify that no modifications were made, and that no cross-connections are visible.

(2) Pumps and cquipment, equipment room signs, and cxposed piping in cquipment room shail be
checked.

(3) Valves shall be checked to cnsure that valve lock scals are still in place and intact. Valve control
door signs shall be checked to verify that no signs have been removed.

163031.11.2.2 Cross-Connection Test. The procedure for determining cross-connection shall be
followed by the applicant in the presence of the Authority Having Jurisdiction and other authorities
having jurisdiction to determine whether a cross-connection has occurred as follows:

(1) The potable water system shall be activated and pressurized. The reehiied-treeyeled alternatc
water source system shall be shut down, depressurized, and drained.

(2) The potable water system shall remain pressurized for a minimum period of time specified by
the Authority Having Jurisdiction while the reclstmed-treeyeiedy altemate water sourcc system 15
empty. The minimum period the reelaimed{reeyeled) allernate water source system is to rcmain
depressurized shall be determined on a case-by-case basis, taking into account the size and
complexity of the potable and the reelaimed-treeyeled) alternate water source distribution systems,
but in no case shall that period be less than 1 hour,

(3) The drain on the reclaimed{reeyeled) altemnate water source system shall be checked for flow
during the test and fixtures, potable and reelaimed-freeveledy alternate water source, shall be tested
and inspected for flow. Flow from an seclaimed—treeyeled) altcmale waler source sysiem outlet
indicates a cross-connection. No flow from a potable water outlet shall indicate that it is connected
to the reetaimed-reeveled) alternate water source system.

(4) The potable water system shall then be depressurized and drained.

(5) The reelaimed-treeyeled) altcrnate water source system shall then be activated and pressurized.
(6) The reclaimed{reeyeled) alternate water source system shall remain pressurized for a minimum
period of time specified by the Authority Having Jurisdiction while the potable water system is
empty. The minimum period the potable water sysiem is to rcmain depressurized shall be
determined on a case-by-case basis, but in no case shall that period be fess than | hour.

(7) Fixtures, potable and reelatmed-treeyeled) altcrnate water source, shall be tested and inspected
for flow. Flow from a potable water system outlet indicates a cross-conncction. No flow from an
reelaimed-freeyeled) alternate water source outlet will indicate that it is connected to the potable
water system.

(8) The drain on the potable water system shall be checked for flow during the test and at the end of
the test.

(9) Where there is no flow detected in the fixtures which would indicatc a cross-connection, the
potable water system shall be repressurized.

2015 Guide To Important Cade Changes 45



1501.11 Inspection and Testing (continued)

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

165031.11.2.3 Discovery of Cross-Connection, In the event that a cross-connection is discovered,
the following procedure, in the presence of the Authority Having Jurisdiction, shall be activated
immediately:

(1) The reelaimed-treeyeted) alternate water source piping to the building shall be shut down at the
meter, and the reelsimedtresveted) alternate walter source riser shall be drained.

(2) Potable water piping to the building shall be shut down at the meter.

{3} The cross-connection shall be uncovered and disconnected.

(4) The building shall be retested felleeins—procedure—tisted in accordance with Section
165031.11.2.1 and Scetion 163031.11.2.2.

(5) The potable water system shall be chlorinated with 50 parts-per-million (ppm) chlorine for 24
hours,

(6) The potable water system shall be flushed after 24 hours, and a standard bacteriological test shall
be performed. Where test results are acceptable, the potable water system shall be permitted to be
recharged.

165031,11.2.4 Annual Inspection. An annual inspection of the reclsimeddsecyeled).alicrmate waier
source system, following the procedures listed in Section 165031.11.2.1 shall be required. Annual
cross-conncction testing, following the procedures listed in Section 165031.11.2.2 shall be required
by the Authority Having Jurisdiction, unless site conditions do not require it. In no event shall the
test occur less than once in 4 ycars. Alternate testing requirements shall be permitted by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction.

These sections add language to provide the end user regulations for inspection and testing for
alternate water systems, supply inspection and testing, annual cross connection ispection and
testing, visual system inspection, and cross conncction testing. This language follows the same
protocols as the IAPMO Green Plumbing and Mechanical Code Supplement (GPMCS). They guide
the AH! and end user with prescriptive measures in cach heading of the section.

Previously, there were 2 identical code provisions for Inspection and Testing in this chapter. One
wis in the reclaimed water section; the other was in the onsite treated water section. Instead of having
2 sections saying the exact same thing, Inspection and Testing was moved to General provisions and
now is only referenced in both sections. All this change did was remove duplication of text.

There is no debate as to the need for healthy and safe potable water to sateguard the public. Inspectors
and jurisdictions in general need to ensure that the required inspections and testing take place at the
appropriate times. Without verifying that all measures arc in place to safeguard the potable water
systems from graywater, the situation could arisc where the potable water becomces compromised
lcading to a wide range of negative results that range from poor tasting water on the mild end to
illness and even death at the severe end. If this situation were to occur. the installer. inspector, and
Jurisdiction could be exposed to liability for any damages.

46

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



1501.12 Separation Requirements

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

1501.12 Separation Reguirements. Underground altermate water source service piping other than
prav_water shall be separated from the building sewer in_accordance with this code. Treated

nonpotable water pipes shall be permitted to be run or laid in the same trench as potable water pipes
with a 12 inch (305 mm) minimum vertical and horizontal separation where both pipe materials are
approved for use within a building. Where horizontal_piping materials_do not comply with_this
requirement the minimum separation shall be increased 10 60 inches (1524 mm). The potable waicr

piping shall be installed at an elevation above the treated nonpotable water piping.

This change was brought about to incorporatc and consolidate language from the IAPMO Green
Plumbing and Mechanical Code Supplement (GPMCS).

There arc 2 scparate scenarios in 150112,

Onc - when the alternate water source piping is scparated from the building sewer. Where this is the
casc, Scction 609.2 in this Code applies. Section 609.2 does not address the materials for the water
piping. This scction stipulates that both sewer and water piping both must be approved within the
building to be laid in the same trench. Any piping not approved within the building still requires
twelve inches of separation for crosses, sec section 609.2 (2).

Two — when the alternate water source piping is separated from potable water pipes. Where this is
the case, this section applics. Both the treated nonpotable water pipe and the potable water pipe
must be approved material for usc within a building. This means that both pipc materials have to
comply with Table 604.1 for Watcr Distribution Pipe.

201S Guide To Important Cade Changes

47



1504.7 On-Site Treated Nonpotable Water Devices and Systems

What Changed 16504.7 On-Site Treated Nonpotable Water Devices and Systems. Devices or cquipment used to
trcat on-site treated nonpotable water in order to maintain the minimum water quality requirements
determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction shall be listed or labeled (third-party certified) by a
listing agency (accredited conformity assessment body) emd or approved for the intended
application. Devices or gquipment used to treat on-sile treated nonpotable water for use in water
closet and urinal flushing, surface irrigation, and similar applications shall be listed or labeled 1o
NSF 350, or approved by the Autherity Havine Jurisdiction.

Why It Changed This additional language gives guidance for the standards used for components in devices and
cquipment uscd to treat non-potable water for above and below urade irrigation, toilet and urinal
flushing.
What It Means This section gives more guidance to on-site treated non potable water. Tt helps consolidate and
-+ ToMe . provide consistency with the IAPMO Green Plumbing.and.Mechanical. Supplement (GEMCS ).eTh¢

AHJ still has the authority to use mare stringent standards based on Statc and Local water quality
standards. The standard NSF 350 is cited for devices and components.

[%.

T e g e T SR SRS |-r—-—r-r1—|—-g—:-f-;=_-_p__,_-_£ #]

i : d
T I l" ] -- _L L e —
On-Site Water Treatment System
Image Courtesy of Wahaso

48 2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



Chapter 16 Nonpotable Rainwater Catchment Systems General Changes

What Changed 1601.0 General.

1601.1 Applicability. The provisions of this chapter shall apply to the installation, construction,
alteration, and repair of nonpotable rainwatcr catchment systems.

1601.1.1 Allowable Use of Alternate Water. Where approved or required by the Authority
Having

Jurisdiction, rainwater shall be permitted to be used in lieu of potable water for the applications
identified in this chapier.

1601.2 Svstem Design. Rainwater catchment systems shall be designed in accordance with this
chapter by a person registered or licensed to perform phumbing design work or who demonstrates
competency to desion_the rainwater catchment system as reguired by the Authority Having
Jurisdiction. Components. piping. and fittings used in a rainwater catchinent system shall be listed.
Exceptions:

{1) A person_registered or licensed to perform plumbing desian work is not required Lo design
rainwater catchment systems used for irrigation with a_maximum storage capacity of 360 gallons
(1363 L.

(2) A person _registered or licensed_to perform plumbing design work is not required to design
rainwater catchment svstems for single familv_dwellings where outlets. piping, and_system

components arc located on the exterior of the building.

1601.3 Permit. It shall be unlawful for a person to construct, install, alter, or cause to_be
constructed, installed, or altered a_rsinwater catchment_system in a building or on a premise
without first obtaining a permit to do such work from the Authority Having Jurisdiction.
Exceptions:

(1) A permit _is not required for exierior rainwater calchment systems used for outdoor drip and
subsurface irrigation with a maximum slorage capaci X

(2} A plumbing permit is not required for rainwater catchment systems for single family dwellings
where outlets, piping, and system components are located on the exterior of the building. This does
not exempt the need for permits where required for electrical connections. tank_supports, or
enclosures,

1601.4 Component ldentification. System components shall be properly identified as to the
manufacturer.

1601.5 Maintenance and Inspection. Rainwater_catchment systems and components shall be
inspected and maintained in accordance with Section 1601.5.1 through Section 1601.5.3.

1601.5.1 Frequency. Rainwater catchment systems and components shall be inspected and
maintained in accordance with Table 1601.5 unless more frequent inspection and maintenance is

required by the manufacturer,

1601.5.2 Maintenance Log. A maintenance_log for rainwater calchment svstems is required 1o
have a permit in accordance with Section_1601.3 and shall be maintained by the property owner
and be available for inspection. The property_ owner or designated appointec shall ensure that a
record of testing, inspection. and maintenance in_accordance with Table 1601.5 is maintaincd in

the log. The log will indicate the frequency of inspection and maintenance for cach system.

1601.5.3 Maintenance Responsibility. The rcquired maintenance and inspection of rainwater
catchment systems shall be the responsibility of the property owner, unless otherwise required by

the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 49



Chapter 16 Nonpotable Rainwater Catchment Systems General Changes

What Changed TABLE 1601.5
MINIMUM ALTERNATE WATER SOURCE TESTING, INSPECTION, AND
MAINTENANCE FREQUENCY
| DESCRIPTION MINIMUM FREQUENCY |
Inspect and clean filters and screens, and Every 3 months
replace (where necessary).
Inspect and verify that disinfection, filters, and | In accordance with manufacturer's
water quality treatment devices and systems are | instructions, and the Authority Having
operational and maintaining minimum water Jurisdiction,
gquality requirements as determined by the
| Authority Having Jurisdiction. i
Inspect and clear debris from rainwater putters, | Every 6 months
dow_nsgouts! and roof washers, |
Inspect and clear debris from roof or other Every 6 months
abovesround ruinwater collection surfaces.
A s tree heunehe LN s {ed gsnceded
T overhanging roof or other aboveground
rainwater collection surfaces.
Inspect pumps and verify operation, | After initia] installation and every 12 months
thereafter
Inspect valves and verify operation, After initial installation and every [2 months
- thereafter
Inspect pressure tanks and verity operation. After initial installation and every 12 months
| thereatier
Clear debris from and inspect storare tanks, | Afier initial installation and every |2 months
. locking devices, and verify operation, thereafter
Inspect caution labels and marking, After initial installation and everv |2 months
thereafter
Cross-connection inspection and test* Adtler initial installation and every 12 months
thereaficr
Test water quality of rinwater catchment I Every 12 months. After system renovation or
| systems required by Section 1602.9.4 to repair.
| ainfain a minimum water guality
i * The cross-connection test shall be performed in the presence of the Authority Having Jurisdiction
in accordance with the requirements of this chapter.
1601.6 Operation and Maintenance Manual. An operation and maintenance manual for raipwalter
catchiment systems required to have a permit in accordance with Section |601.3 shall be supplied 1o
the building owner by the system designer, The operating and maintenance manual shall include the
following:
1) Detailed diagram of the entire system angl the location of system components,
{2} [nstructions on operating and maintaining the system.,
{3) Details on maintaining the required water guality as determined by the Authority Haviny
Jurisdiction,
(4} Details on deactivating the svstem for maintenance, repair, or other purposcs.
(31 Applicable testing, inspection. and maintenance frequencics in accordance with Table 1601.5.
(6) A method of contacting the manufacturer(s).
I 50 2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



Chapter 16 Nonpotable Rainwater Catchment Systems General Changes

What Changed

Why it Changed

1601.7 Minimum_Water Quality Requirements. The minimum water guality for rainwater
catchment svstems shall comply with_the applicable water quality_requircments for the intended
application as determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. Water quality for nonpotable
rainwater catchment svstems shall comply with Section 1602.9.4.

Exceptions:

(1) Waltcr treatment is not required for rainwater catchunent systems used for aboveground irrigation
with a maximum storage cupacity of 360 gallons (1363 L).

(2) Water treatment is not required for rainwater_catchment systems used for subsurface or drip
irrigation.

1601.8 Material Compatibility. Rainwater catchment systems shall be constructed of materials that
are compatible with the type of pipe and fitting materials, water treatment, and water conditions in
the svstem,

1601.9 Svstem Controls. Controls for pumps, valves, and other devices that contain mercury that
come in contact with rainwater supply shall not be permitted.

1601.10_Separation Requirements. Underground rainwater catchment_scrvice piping_shall be
separated from the building sewer in gecordance with Section 609.2. Treated nonpotable water pipes
shall be permitted to be run or laid in the same trench as potable water pipes with a 12 inch {305
mm) minimum vertical and_horizontal separation where both pipe_materials are approved for use
within a building. Where horizontal piping_materials do not meet this requirement_the minimurm
separation shall be increased to 60 inches (1524 mm). The potable water piping shall be installed at
an elevation above the treagted nonpotable water piping,

1601.11 Abandonment. Rainwater catchment systems that are no longer in use or fail to be
maintained in accordance with Section 1601.5 shall be_abandoncd. Abandonment shall comply with
Scction 1601.11.1 and Scction 1604.11.2.

1601.11.1 General. An abandoned svstem or part thereof covered under the scope of this chapter
shall be disconnected from remaining systems, _drained,_plugeed, and capped in an_approved
Manner,

1601.11.2 Undereround Tank. An underground water storage tank that has_been abandoned or
otherwise discontinued from use in a system_covered under the scope of this chapter shall be
completely drained and filled with _earth, sand, sravel, concrele, or other approved material or
removed in a manner satisfactory to the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

1601.12 Sizine. Unless otherwise provided for in this chapter, rainwater catchment piping shall be

sized in accordance with Chapter 6 for sizing potable water piping.

These changes were made to consolidate and add consistency with the 2012 Green Plumbing and
Mechanical Code Supplement.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 51



Chapter 16 Nonpotable Rainwater Catchment Systems General Changes

What It Means

To Me

These scctions add a road map of design, maintenance, maintenance frequency, responsibility

water quality inspection and testing, controls, maintenance logs, sizing, permits, abandonment,
underground tanks, component identification and persons qualificd to design rain watcr systems, It
is @ more comprehensive sct of prescriptive requirements than in the previous code. It will add the
end user prepare and install systems and give inspectors a clear guideline for inspections testing
and the required logs to be kept by the owner of rain water sysiems. Again, most of these changes
were the result of moving provisions from the Alternatc Water Sources chapter to the Rainwater
Chapter. The provisions were already in the 2012 UPC. The 2012 UPC did not accurately divide
between these two chapters,

Qre—=remaimm  Typical Cnmmarcgg!‘ ﬂgg!icatmn

P cely.

THE RAINWATER RE-USE
PROCESS

Haw it Works n A Commsenial Application

e e
oty of e ol srteces e e o
PO ey oy amier Bhumienie] ster b o8
acamgia of hom & rEEe—— ekl

b umar} i) & CorERartid o pileaton,
-
oo P i e e o s P

Image Courtesy of the US Green Building Council (USGBC)

52

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



1602.6 Sizing

What Changed 17602.6 Sizing. Rainwater- i,‘l.ili:hHiﬁﬂl—h#S%EﬂFdhiﬂﬂtﬂlﬁikﬁ-ﬁHﬂ—F&f—H&kﬁF—?ﬁﬁitMiurﬂ‘r—‘:hﬂ-u—lﬁﬁ

sized-as—outlinedinthis—cede for sizinaepatable—water—piping: The design and size of rainwater
drains. sutters, conductors, and leaders shall comply with Chapter 11 of this cede,

Why It Changed This section clarifies the sizing requirements of leader and gutter.
What It Means By clanfym&, that sizing shall be Chapter 11 of the UPC, the designer and cnd user have a clear path
To Me to size these systems. Improper sizing of the rainwater catchment sysicm components can lead to a

wasting of water that could have otherwisc been capturcd or utilized or can lead to incfficient or
slow roof drainage. Over time, this overloading could lead to the failurc of these componcents or
cven property damage resulting from additional water not being managed away from the structure.

2015 Guide To Important Code Changes 53



1602.9.3 Rainwater Catchment System Surfaces

What Changed 17602.9.3 Colleetion-Rainwater Catchment Svstem Surfaces. Rainwater shall be collected from
roof surfaces—A—rainwatereatchmentsystemshall-noeallectrainwater: or other manmade, above
ground collection surfaces.

i ehteulaepaskipesurhiees
P surficewater arpe

17602.9.3.1 Prohibited Dischurges-Qther Surfaces. Everflewsand-bload-offpipes—tram—rooi-
mouted-equipment-and-upphances shall-net discharse onto-roofsurfaces-that are-intended-to-collect
snwater—Natural precipitation collected trom surface water runoff, vehicular parking surfices, or
manmade surfaces at or below grade shall be in accordance with the stormwater reguirements for
on-site treated nonpotable water svstems in Section 1304.0.

Why It Changed This scction gives a clear understanding of what surfaces are allowed to be collected from and
provides clarity to other surfaces and the code section that applics to_storm_water and.othernons
potable on-site treated water.

What It Means The owner and inspector have a clear roadmap of approved collection surfaces. This section gives

To Me clear dircction to the different applications and approved collection surfaces other than those
approved for rainwater. The requircments for other surfaces can be found in Section 504, By
limiting the collection of rainwater to above ground surfaces the codc is guarding against more toxic
contaminants from being collected from arcas exposed to vehicle traffic, fertilizer, other waste, and
other chemicals and contaminants that may be present at ground level.

54 2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



1602.9.5.8 Storage Tank Venting

What Changed

Why It Changed

What It Means
To Me

1602.9.5.8 Storage Tank Venting. Where venting_bv_means of drainage or overflow piping is not
nrovided, or is considered insufficicnt. a vent shall be installed on each tank. The veat shail extend
from the top of the tank and tertninate not less than 6 inches (152 mm) above grade and shall be nat
less than |12 inches (40 mm) in _diameter. The vent terminal shall be directed downward and
covered with a 332 of an inch (2.4 mm) mesh_screen to prevent the entry of vermin and inscets.

This scction was added to reflect consistency with IAPMO Green Plumbing and Mechanical Code
Supplement. Clear guidance on tank venting is provided.

This section gives the owner and end user clear guidance to venting requirement of storage tanks as
well as bug screens to prevent insect intrusion. Venting of the tank will allow the tank to function as
designed and the inclusion of the mesh screen reduces the potential for contamination from bugs and
other small animals that could lcad to the damage of otherwise vulnerable components in the
system.

Vent with .125 inch or 3175 micron bug
screen to prevent mosquitos and insects

Image Courtesy of Buildingincalifornia.com

2015 Guide To important Code Changes

55



1602.11.1 Supply System Inspection and Test

What Changed

Why it Changed

What It Means
To Me

17602.11.1 Supply System Inspection and Test. Rainwater catchment systcms shall be inspected
and tested in accordance with the applicable provisions of this code for testing of potable water and
storm drainage systems. Storage tanks shall be filled with water to the overflow opening for a period
of 24 hours, and during inspection, or by other means as approved by the Authorily Having
Jurisdiction. Scams and joints shall be exposed during inspection and checked for water tightness.

This section was added to reflect consistency with IAPMO Green Plumbing and Mechanical Code
Supplement.

Supply system inspection and test can only mean that cross conncction likely hood has been
minimized and the health and safety of a building’s occupants will not be compromised. The added
language is beneficial to the end user and owners as the possibility of cross conncction has been
minimized for the health and safety of the occupants. Clearer guidelines make a much improved and
organized section.

56

2015 Uniform Plumbing Code®



