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This is  the Promise of Justice 
Initiative ’s third report on the 
East Baton Rouge Parish (EBR) 
criminal legal system. Our first 
report,  “Punished Protesters  in 
Baton Rouge, ” examined the 
events following the police 
shooting of A lton Sterling in the 
summer of 2016 and specifically 
highlighted the excess ive use of 
police force employed against 
civil rights activists. Our second 
report,  “Dying in E ast Baton 
Rouge Parish Prison, ” 
considered the harsh and often 
deadly conditions people face 
while  incarcerated at the East 
Baton Rouge Parish Prison. This 
report examines the polic ing 
tactics that Baton Rouge law 
enforcement agencies have 
used over the past two hundred 
years until the present day and 
finds that these methods are 
racist and violent and that they 
systematically  over-police and 
over-incarcerate Black people. 
U ltimately ,  the information in 
this report provides historical 
and factual support for the 
community  efforts  to abolish 
E BR law enforcement agencies 
and to re invest that funding into 
social services and local 
organizations that address the 
root causes of crime,  such as  
poverty  and education 
inequality. 
 

EBR law enforcement agencies 
regularly advance the narrative 
that aggressive polic ing tactics 
are necessary to keep people 
safe ,  but our research 
uncovered s ignificant 
discrepancies between offic ial 
accounts and what the data 
reveals . In one significant 
example,  the Baton Rouge 
Police Department (BRPD) 
arrested 1, 241 individuals  
between N ovember 15  and 
December 19 of 2018 in a 
police-driven,  punitive 
campaign ostensibly to reduce 
homicides and violent crime 
rates. While the BRPD later 
claimed a s ignificant reduction 
in violent crimes following these 
arrest sweeps,  our analys is of 
available public data reveals 
that this brutal initiative resulted 
in no meaningful reduction of 
violent crime rates ,  while  the 
resource expenditure was 
considerable. Only 18.9% of 
those arrested were charged 
with a violent crime,  and just 
4.9% of those arrested were 
convicted of a violent crime.1 
These arrest sweeps 
disproportionately affected 
Black communities  and 
undermined confidence in the 
criminal legal system while 
having no impact on community  
well-being or the violent crime 
rate.  

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 
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With a jail population rate that is 
66% higher than the national 
average,  there is  statistical 
proof that EBR readily  
weaponizes over-polic ing and 
incarceration to address what 
are in fact social and societal 
problems. The impact of law 
enforcement’s punitive 
measures disproportionally falls 
on poor people and 
communities of color,  as 
exemplified by the fact that 
over 70% of individuals  arrested 
during the sweeps were Black in 
a parish that is only 47 .2% Black.2  
Even more tellingly ,  the EBR 
Prison population is  more than 
75% Black.3 The consequences 
of arrest,  confinement,  and 
incarceration are s ignificant not 
only for the person facing 
charges,  but for their families,  
neighborhoods,  and entire  
communities. These negative 

repercussions often extend far 
beyond the duration of 
confinement; incarceration has 
an immeasurable impact on jobs 
and income,  custody of children 
and childcare status ,  and 
physical and mental health.  
 

As this  report illustrates ,  
increased police surveillance,  
arrests,  and imprisonment 
should not function as the 
primary  deterrents for crime or 
the cornerstones of public 
safety. Instead of punishing 
communities for the inevitable 
turmoil of social inequity ,  we 
must imagine a new reality 
without law enforcement as the 
primary  provider of public 
safety assistance. If E BR wants  
to protect its  community 
members and curtail crime 
rates,  parish officials  should 
work to prevent crime from 
occurring in the first place by 
funneling funding into 
addressing the root causes 
(such as  poverty and racism) 
rather than arresting and 
incarcerating people plagued by 
societal inequity . 
  

INTRODUCTION   
  

In the wake of the killing of 
George Floyd by a Minneapolis  
police officer who knelt on Mr. 
F loyd’s neck for over 8 minutes ,  
people in c ities  and towns 

over  70% of  ind iv idual s 

arres ted  during  the sweeps  

were  Black  in  a  par ish  tha t  
is  only 47.2% Black. i  Even 

more tel l ingl y ,  the  EBR 

Pr ison populat ion i s  more  

than 75% Black.  
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across America took to the 
streets  to protest police 
brutality and the racist policing 
systems that caused Mr. F loyd’s  
death. People in Louis iana’s  
capital c ity  of Baton Rouge 
organized and marched in 
solidarity with the Black L ives 
Matter movement. In the 
summer of 2020,  Louisianans 
protested the police killing of 
Trayford Pellerin,  who was shot 
at 11 times and killed by police 

officers  as  he attempted to walk 
away from them.4  
 
In the midst of the national 
upheaval and conversation over 
the appropriate role of law 
enforcement agencies,  this  
report focuses on both the 
history  and current status of 
polic ing in E BR and what the 
future of polic ing should look 
like. F rom early police forces in 
the 1800s terrorizing enslaved 
people,  to those same police 

A demonstrator protesting the shooting death of Alton Sterling is detained by law enforcement near 

the headquarters of the Baton Rouge Police Department in Baton Rouge, LA on July 9, 2016. Credit: 

Jonathan Bachman via Reuters/TIME Magazine  
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forces actively enforcing white 
supremacy during the C ivil 
Rights Movement,  to still those 
same police forces killing 
scores of Black men in the 
decades s ince,  Black res idents 
of EBR have lived under an 
uninterrupted re ign of police 
violence and control for over 
two centuries. 
 

In the present day ,  EBR is  
Louis iana’s  most populous 
parish (a parish is  an 
administrative/political 
des ignation equivalent to a 
county  in other states),  and it 
includes both the c ity  of Baton 
Rouge and the much smaller 
cities  of Baker,  Central,  and 
Zachary,  as well as 
unincorporated parish land.5 EBR 
has around 440, 000 res idents ,  
half of whom live in the city of 
Baton Rouge. Roughly half of 
the parish’s  population is  Black,  
and EBR has remained 
essentially  segregated.6 The 
parish has a unified municipal 
government,  which means that 
the majority-Black c ity  of Baton 
Rouge shares a government 
with E BR’s other c ities ,  towns,  
and unincorporated land,  which 
are more suburban or rural and 
have a much higher percentage 
of white res idents.  
 

The last decade has been one 
of momentous social and 
demographic change in EBR. 

Though seemingly  unrelated,  
there are two events  that are 
deeply  illustrative of the 
challenges faced by the 
res idents  of E BR during the past 
several years . F irst,  on July 5th,  
2016,  Alton Sterling,  a 37-year-
old Black man,  was shot to 
death by BRPD officers. Weeks 
of protests and calls  for police 
accountability  followed the 
shooting,  which garnered 
national attention. The white 
officers  who killed him were not 
prosecuted,  and only one lost 
his  job. The absence of any real 
repercussions for these officers  
further damaged an already 
strained relationship between 
the Black community in EBR and 
EBR law enforcement agencies. 
Second,  on October 12th,  2019,  
res idents  in an unincorporated 
section of EBR voted to form 
their own city  called St. George,  
claiming that Baton Rouge’s 
public school performance and 
crime rates were the impetus.7 
This new city  will be 
predominantly white and much 
wealthier than the c ity of Baton 
Rouge. The incorporation of St. 
George is seen by many in the 
community as an illustration of 
EBR’s segregation,  inequality ,  
and racial tens ions. These 
events over the last several 
years provide snapshots of 
EBR’s deepest challenges : 
divestment from social services,  
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over-polic ing,  and segregation. 
Moreover,  they show a 
community struggling to 
adequately deal with a plague 
of social problems. 
 
EBR has relied on aggressive 
polic ing and mass incarceration 
to address its  societal 
challenges,  allowing bias  and 
fear,  rather than data and 
effectiveness,  to inform its  
strategies . A  2017  report by 
Together Baton Rouge 
compared drug usage between 
people in EBR liv ing in four 
majority-Black z ip codes with 
those liv ing in majority-white z ip 
codes and found that drug 
usage is actually 0 .6% lower in 
the majority-Black zip-codes.8 
However,  people living in the 
majority-Black z ip codes had a 
513% higher chance of getting 
arrested for drug offenses than 
the people liv ing in the 
majority-white z ip-codes .9 The 
population of the parish prison 
(known elsewhere as a jail) is 
consistently  over 75% Black,  and 
the total prison population is  
over 66% higher than the 
national average.10 These 
factors,  combined with systemic 
divestment from Black 
communities and a steady 
history  of police brutality  
against its Black residents,  have 
led these communities to 

deeply  distrust law 
enforcement.  

 

This is  the Promise of Justice 
Initiative ’s third report on the 
criminal legal system in EBR. 
Our first report detailed the 
overwhelming abuse endured 
by civil rights  activ ists 
protesting the police shooting 
of Alton Sterling.11 Each of the 
protestors we interviewed for 
that report noted—beyond the 
painful and abusive conditions 
that they themselves endured—
that individuals detained on 
regular charges faced worse 
conditions and harsher 
treatment. Our second report 
examined the conditions 

From earl y  pol ice  fo rces  in  the  
1800s  ter ror iz ing  enslaved 

people,  to  those same pol ice  

forces  ac t ively  enfo rc ing white  

supremacy  dur ing  the Civ il  
Rights  Movement ,  to st i l l  

those same pol ice  fo rces  

kil l ing  sco res  of  Black  men in  

the  decades s ince,  Black  
residents  o f  EBR  have l ived 

under an  uninter rupted  re ign 

of  pol ice v iolence and  cont rol  

for  over two  centuries .  
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endured by ordinary res idents ,  
and the grave risk of death and 
other serious body injury for 
those incarcerated at East Baton 
Rouge Parish Prison.12 In the 
course of research for our 
second report,  we became 
deeply  concerned about the 
demographics  of those held in 
the parish prison. This concern 
led us to broaden our scope to 
further investigate the patterns 
of arrests underly ing the prison 
population. 
 

This report examines the many 
law enforcement agencies  that 
operate within E BR,  such as  the 
BRPD,  E ast Baton Rouge Parish 
Sheriff’s  Office (EBRSO),  
Southern Univers ity  Police 
Department,  Louis iana State 
Univers ity Police Department,  
Crimestoppers ,  Louis iana State 
Police,  Bureau of Alcohol,  
Tobacco,  and F irearms,  Federal 
Bureau of Investigation,  Drug 
Enforcement Administration,  
East Baton Rouge D istrict 
Attorney’s  O ffice ,  United States 
Probation and Parole Services 
of the Middle District of 
Louis iana,  and the U.S. 
Attorney’s  O ffice . Although 
many agencies  operate within 
EBR,  BRPD and EBRSO  are the 
primary  focus of this report 
because local advocacy efforts 
have the potential to have an 
impact on the future of these 
agencies . And despite 

exhaustive research confirming 
that over-polic ing does not 
enhance safety  or build 
confidence in the legal system,  
each of these agencies has 
continually committed to 
increased and more aggress ive 
polic ing. These agencies should 
be re imagined,  and BPRD and 
EBRSO funding should be 
diverted to social services 
programs that actually serve 
and protect the EBR community.   
 

This report proceeds in three 
parts. Part I describes the long 
history  of racist and brutal 
police tactics in E BR that had 
already been taking place long 
before A lton Sterling was shot 
by police in 2016 . Part II 
examines the more recent 
examples of this destructive 
polic ing both nationwide and in 
EBR that have led to the 
massive protests in the summer 
and fall of 2020. Part III 
discusses why,  in light of this  
long history and current 
practice of structural racism and 
brutality,  law enforcement 
agencies  are poorly suited to 
provide social services to EBR 
and why their funding should be 
re invested into the EBR 
community. 
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There is  a long and sordid 
history  of distrust between law 
enforcement and the Black 
community in E BR that well 
predates the modern era. 
 
In Louisiana,  before the advent 
of modern polic ing,  “militia 
forces and soldiers  were 
entrusted with law enforcement 
duties” until the late 1800s .13 
These militia forces were tasked 
with enforcing the Black C ode,  
which the first legislature in 
Louis iana enacted in 1806 to 
regulate the sale,  labor,  
freedom,  and daily  lives  of 
enslaved people and free 
people of color.14 The Black 
Code was amended in 1865 
after the C ivil War to require ex-
slaves to enter into contracts 
with their previous masters  for 
years of indentured servitude,  
and the punishment for 

“disobedience” included 
imprisonment and fines.15 The 
Sheriff’s  office was given the 
express power to enforce the 
Black C ode.16 Thus,  the 
foundation for modern polic ing 
was built on decades of 
enforcing racist and violently  
oppressive laws meant to 
prevent the acquis ition of 
property,  free movement,  and 
any sense of phys ical safety  for 
Black people in EBR. 
 
The BRPD was formed in 1865 
amidst the Reconstruction-era 
power struggle between white 
people and newly freed 
enslaved people. The BRPD in 
1865 was an entirely white 
police force and did not employ 
any Black officers until 1963,  
almost a century  after its  
inception.17 During the period 
from 1877 until 1950,  at least 
549 Black people were lynched 
in Louis iana.18 These extra-
judic ial murders  were either 
tacitly or expressly  allowed by 
law enforcement as  punishment 
for suspected crimes.19 The 
police also served as  the 
primary  enforcers  of J im Crow 
laws that existed principally  in 
order to denigrate and 
dehumanize Black people .20  

PART I: POLICE BRUTALITY AND 

RACIST POLICING IN EBR BEFORE 

ALTON STERLING’S MURDER 

 

Between 1967 and  1972,  

“off icers  shot  and  kil l ed a t  
leas t  one young  Black  male  

suspect  each year . ”  
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During the 1940s ,  in the years  
leading up to the C ivil Rights  
Movement,  Black community 
members spoke out and 
testified against the BRPD and 
the EBRSO  for their racist and 
brutal actions.21 In response,  on 
December 25 ,  1942,  police 
“launched a raid into one of 
South Baton Rouge’s  [B]lack 
neighborhoods. Armed with 
sawed-off shotguns,  
submachine guns,  revolvers,  
and tear gas,  they combed the 
area,  terroriz ing the citizenry” 
and arrested 69 Black people.22 
As later sections of this  report 
discuss,  targeted mass arrests  
of Black people is a tactic that 
EBR law enforcement agencies 
continue to use with alarming 
frequency . 
 
Between 1967 and 1972,  
“officers  shot and killed at least 
one young Black male suspect 
each year.”23 On N ovember 16 ,  
1972,  police officers fired shots 
at people peacefully 
demonstrating at Southern 
Univers ity,  killing two young 
Black students in a display  of 
police brutality coined the 
Southern Univers ity  Massacre .24 
Between 1988 and 1991,  there 
were 153 excess ive force 
complaints filed against BRPD 
officers ,  with Black 
complainants  filing three times 

as many as  white complainants .25 
Very  few of these resulted in 
any disciplinary  action against 
the officers.26 In 1992,  BRPD 
officers  killed Patrick Esco,  a 
28-year-old Black man with 
intellectual disabilities ,  and 
Chauncey Thomas,  a 15-year-
old boy who was shot to death 
while  running away.27  In addition 
to these incidents  of police 
brutality during the 1990s and 
2000s,  which are not exhaustive 
of the period,  there were 
several documented instances 
of BRPD officers  forcing 
themselves sexually onto 
women and then threatening to 
arrest or harm the women if 
they res isted.28  
 

East Baton Rouge Parish Prison. Wallis Watkins/WRKF via KEDM 
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After Hurricane Katrina hit 
southeast Louis iana in 2005,  
teams of police officers  from 
the New Mexico State Police 
and the Michigan State Police 
came to Baton Rouge to ass ist 
the BRPD with polic ing after 
many evacuees and refugees 
fled to the c ity .29 Both teams 
pulled out of Baton Rouge 
within two days because of 
BRPD officers’ v iolent and racist 
behavior. The out-of-town 
officers  alleged that BRPD 
officers  were “striking suspects  
in handcuffs,  shooting innocent 
bystanders with taser guns and 
destroy ing property  for no 
apparent reason.”30 They also 
alleged that BRPD officers  
referred to Black people as  
“heathens” and “animals” that 
“needed to be beaten down.”31 In 
one case,  a BRPD officer 
“offered to let a v is iting trooper 
beat an inmate as  a thank-you 
gift.”32 At the close of a several-
year investigation into these 
incidents ,  the only  resulting 
punishment was a three-day 
suspension for one officer,  a 
reprimand for another officer,  
and ordered counseling for 
three others.33 
 
In the years between 2005 and 
2016,  offic ial documentation 
shows that 16  people were 
killed by EBR law enforcement,  
and 14 of those 16 were Black 

men.34 On April 22,  2016,  a BRPD 
officer was captured on video 
punching a Black 16-year-old 
boy repeatedly in the back of 
the head while  other officers 
had the boy restrained on the 
ground with his  hands behind 
his  back.35 
 
These practices are not limited 
solely to outward instances of 
racism and violence. BRPD also 
has a long and documented 
history  of racist hiring practices 
within its own ranks. As 
mentioned above,  Black police 
officers  have only been 
employed by BRPD s ince 1963—
for almost a century between 
1865 and 1963,  the police force 
was entirely  white.36 BRPD was 
placed under a consent decree 
from 1980 until 2019 due to 
discrimination in hiring Black 
and female applicants.37  
 
The racist and violent history of 
EBR law enforcement agencies 
is not a problem relegated to 
the distant past. As  the next 
section of this  report explains,  
racist and violent police tactics 
are still a mass ive problem in 
present-day EBR. 
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In the time between Alton 
Sterling’s  murder in 2016 and 
the nation-wide protests  
throughout the summer and fall 
of 2020,  EBR law enforcement 
agencies  have committed many 
racist and violent acts against 
Black Baton Rougeans. This 
section of the report recounts  
many of these acts and also 
analyzes the systemic polic ing 
practices that intentionally  
target Black people today,  
including public ized arrest 
sweeps and mass surveillance 
techniques. 
 
 

ALTON STERLING 
 

On July  5,  2016,  two white BRPD 
officers ,  Blane Salamoni and 
Howie Lake II ,  arrived at the 
Triple S F ood Mart following an 
anonymous tip about a man with 
a gun. Within ninety seconds,  
the officers tasered,  shot,  and 
killed Alton Sterling,  a local 
Black man who frequently sold 
CDs outs ide the convenience 
store. V ideo footage of the 
shooting quickly c irculated,  
prompting thousands to take to 
the streets across the country  in 

protest of A lton Sterling’s  
death—a tragedy emblematic of 
nationwide police brutality and 
excess ive police force against 
people of color,  particularly  
Black men.38 During the protests  
in Baton Rouge,  riot police 
tasered,  maced,  chased,  
tackled,  pepper-sprayed,  and 
arrested nearly 200 protesters . 
The use of force turned what 
was otherwise a peaceful 
demonstration into violent 
police- instigated confrontations 
with civ ilians en masse.39 Those 
who were arrested faced further 
extreme conditions while  

PART II: ALTON STERLING’S MURDER 

AND POLICE BRUTALITY AND RACIST 

POLICING IN EBR THEREAFTER 

Alton Sterling via Facebook 
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detained at East Baton Rouge 
Parish Prison,  including verbal 
abuse from police officers,  
denial of food and water,  
frequent threats of los ing 
access to phones,  and 
cancellation of court hearing 
dates. The treatment of the 
protesters  led to at least three 
separate lawsuits.40  
 
Following the shooting,  both 
officers  were placed on paid 
leave; however,  in May of 2017,  
federal investigators closed the 
investigation after finding 
“insuffic ient evidence” that the 
officers  had acted 
unreasonably .41 No federal 
criminal charges were filed 
against e ither officer.42 In March 
of 2018,  an ensuing state probe 
came to the all-too-familiar 
conclusion seen in similar cases 
across the country when 
Louis iana Attorney General Jeff 
Landry declined to seek 
criminal charges against the 
officers .43 Shortly  after Attorney 
General Landry ’s  
announcement,  BRPD fired 
officer Salamoni.44 Officer Lake 
was allowed to return to work 
after a 3-day suspension.45  
 
One major legacy plaguing 
BRPD in the years  after Mr. 
Sterling’s  death is  the absence 
of any real repercuss ions for the 
officers  involved. This lack of 

accountability  has further 
destroyed the already-broken 
trust between Black 
communities in Baton Rouge 
and BRPD. As a result,  BRPD has 
clumsily attempted to gain 
credibility  by publicly  rolling out 
new tough-on-crime initiatives 
and then reporting afterward 
that these initiatives were 
effective at keeping people 
safe. Some major examples of 
such initiatives are the 2018 
arrest sweeps,  which BRPD has 
touted as  successful. However,  
in researching the BRPD’s 
claims,  we found them to be 
both misleading and incorrect—
a dangerous tactic in the public 
relations struggle to win the 
trust of Black Baton Rougeans.  
 
 

THE 2018 SWEEPS 
 
According to a press briefing by 
BRPD Chief Murphy Paul,  BRPD,  
in conjunction with other law 

Chief  Paul  sa id ,  the  ra id  

targeted the “young males  that  

we see involved,  pa rt icula rly  

the  young  Afr ican-Amer ican 
males that  are  a  part  o f  this  

cul ture  o f  v iolence. ”  
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enforcement agencies,  
undertook mass arrest sweeps 
in mid-N ovember through early 
December of 2018 in response 
to a spike in homicides.  
 
According to our research,  
these arrests were markedly 
racially targeted. O f the 1, 241 
people who were arrested 
during the sweeps between 
November 15 and December 19 
of 2018,  877  were Black,  325 
were white,  20 were Latino,  3 
were Asian,  and 16 were labeled 
as “other.” By percentage,  this 
means 70.7% of those arrested 
were Black and 26 .2% were 
white. This is dramatically  racist 
polic ing,  since the census data 
of EBR indicates that 47 .6% of 
the parish is white and 47.2% is 
Black.46 A Black person liv ing in 
EBR was over 2.5  times more 
likely to be arrested during 
these sweeps than a white 
person. This  is not surprising 
because,  as C hief Paul said,  the 
raid targeted the “young males 
that we see involved,  
particularly  the young African-
American males that are a part 
of this  culture of v iolence.”47 
Further,  394 of that 1, 241 were 
arrested on weapons or drug 
charges,  charges the chief 
mentioned targeting. Of those 
arrested for weapons or drug 
charges,  321 were Black,  67 
were white,  3 were Latino,  1 was 

Asian,  and 1 was “other”. Thus,  a 
Black person was almost 5  
times more likely to be arrested 
for a drug or weapon offense 
than a white person.  
 
This targeting is likely severely 
misdirected,  s ince the sweeps 
were largely  targeting narcotics 
crimes,  and studies have shown 
that Black people use drugs at a 
rate s imilar to white people.48 
This targeting of Black people 
continued into sentencing,  
where there was a statistically  
significant association between 
being non-white and both 
having a longer probation 
period and receiving a higher 
bond amount. There was no 
evidence that individuals 
charged with more serious 
offenses stayed longer in the 
jail.  In fact,  bond amount was 
the only  correlate to length of 
stay found in the data.49 O nce 
arrested and put into the EBR 
Prison for holding,  the length of 
time spent there prior to release 
primarily  depended on the 
individual’s ability  to afford 
bail.50 This is  indicative of the 
economic discrimination of 
keeping people in prison s imply 
for their inability to pay their 
bond.  
 
In addition to being racially  
discriminatory,  the 2018 arrest 
sweeps were also misleadingly 
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reported by the BRPD. BRPD 
claimed that the violent crime 
rate dropped due to these 
sweeps,  which involved 1, 241 
arrests (81% of which were for 
non-violent crimes).51 Statistical 
analys is  undermines this  
assertion. F irst,  there was no 
significant spike in homicides. 
While the 2018 homicide rate 
did rise dramatically  from 
October to N ovember,  this 
appears  to be a regress ion to 
the mean and not an anomalous 
spike. In other words ,  this rise is 
due to an uncharacteristically 
low homicide rate in O ctober,  
not a high homicide rate in 
November.  
 
Second,  the data shows that 
there was no homicide-reducing 
effect from the arrest sweeps. 

Over the past two and a half 
years,  there have been an 
average of 17 homicides per 
month. In the three months 
preceding the sweep,  the 
average was 12 homicides per 
month. In the five months 
following the sweep there were 
an average of 16  homicides per 
month.52 Thus,  contrary to 
BRPD’s assertion,  homicides 
actually increased after the 
arrest sweeps. When the arrest 
sweeps and homicide rates 
were cross  tabulated in a chi-
squared test of association,  
there was no statistically 
significant association that 
could be found.53 And contrary 
to BRPD’s narrative that this  
sweep was intended to curb 
rates of v iolent crime,  only 
18.9% of those arrested were 
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ever charged with a violent 
crime. Furthermore,  of those 
arrested for a violent crime,  
only 4.9% were convicted of a 
violent crime.54 Ultimately,  these 
arrest sweeps created an 
overstated increase in police 
activ ity  meant to confront a 
crime wave that s imply did not 
exist.  
 
There is  even more reason to be 
skeptical of the data given by 
BRPD. F or instance,  in his press  
conference,  BRPD offic ials used 
a drop in property  crime as 
evidence of the effectiveness of 
the sweeps that were 
specifically meant to respond 
only to ris ing homicide rates .55 
However,  there is  no correlation 

between rates of homicide and 
rates of property  crime (in 2015,  
homicide rates rose in our 
nation’s  largest c ities,  despite 
an overall drop in crime).56 
Additionally,  in reporting rates 
of property  crime,  BRPD used 7- 
and 28-day cycles .57 Statistic ians 
warn against us ing cycles of a 
year or less  because 
conclusions drawn from such 
short periods are statistically 
unreliable . F inally,  the numbers  
provided by BRPD do not 
correspond with existing data.58 
BRPD reported that there was 
only one homicide in October of 
2019; however,  data.brla.gov,  
which tracks crime incidents ,  
lists  seven homicides and ten 
attempted homicides in that 



THE PROMISE OF JUSTICE INITIATIVE 
 

 

PJI | Brutality in the Name of “Safety” 
 

17 

month.59 This discrepancy calls 
into question the reliability  of 
BRPD’s data sources,  and 
suggests that BRPD conveyed a 
false sense that over-policing 
tactics  are keeping people safer 
when,  in fact,  the sweeps 
simply lead to more Black 
people being arrested for non-
violent offenses .  
 
At the end of the press 
conference on December 19 ,  
2018,  C hief Paul stated that 
there would be a “monthly  or 
quarterly  operation such as this 
to continue to put the pressure 
on those individuals that we 
believe are responsible for 

violent crimes in our 
community.”60 During the next 
press  conference on March 1,  
2019,  it was repeated that these 
sweeps would continue 
monthly.61  
 
Offic ials speaking during these 
press conferences repeatedly 
stressed that the general public 
should call the police if they 
saw anything suspic ious,  or if 
they had any information about 
a committed crime.62 In one 
press conference,  parents were 
admonished to “search their 
kids ’ rooms,  under their 
mattresses,  in their cars, ” and to 
call the police on their children 
if they find any contraband with 
the promise that there would be 
“no questions asked.”63 Begging 
the public  to trust the police 
and inform on their neighbors  
was a constant theme in these 
press conferences. 
 
 Encouraging community  
cooperation is  only effective 
where there is  trust. Law 
enforcement deeply  undermines 
that trust by  misusing data,  as 
the BRPD did with the data 
surrounding the arrest sweeps,  
in order to mislead the public  
into thinking the police are 
effectively keeping communities 
safer. And Baton Rouge law 
enforcement agencies continue 
to undermine that trust by 

In one press conference,  
parents  were  admonished  to  

“search their  k ids ’  rooms,  

under the i r  matt resses ,  in  

the ir  ca rs , ”  and to  cal l  the 
pol ice  on their  ch ildren if  

they f ind any  cont raband  

with  the  promise  that  there  

would  be “no  quest ions  
asked. ” i Begg ing  the publ ic  

to trust  the  pol ice  and  

info rm on their  neighbors  

was  a  constant theme in 
these  press conferences.  
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increas ingly and misleadingly  
investing in the mass 
surveillance of Black 
communities as an exciting new 
advancement in the world of 
polic ing. 
 
 

REAL TIME CRIME 

CENTER 
 

To address the spike in violent 
crime in 2018,  BRPD unveiled 
the Real T ime Crime Center,  an 
expensive experiment in 
aggressive polic ing and 
surveilling of majority-Black 
communities. The stated goal of 
the Real T ime Crime Center is to 
increase safety  and deter crime 
by integrating c ivilian cameras 
with different agencies ’ data 
and surveillance systems.64 The 
$3 million facility  became fully 
operational in May of 2020.65 
That facility is  a central hub that 
provides police access to 
multiple surveillance systems 
and databases including 
municipal cameras,  license 
plate scanners ,  shot spotter 
technology,  criminal records,  
and on-the-street police 
observations .66 The police also 
request access to cameras 
owned by local residents and 
businesses to use their 
surveillance footage.67 The Real 
Time C rime Center has created 

a map of res idential cameras 
even when those res idents  do 
not consent to sharing their 
camera feeds with the police.68  
 
Baton Rouge’s Real Time C rime 
Center is  one of many s imilar 
projects in heavily-policed cities  
such as  New York,  C hicago,  and 
New O rleans, 69 which have 
inspired techno-envy in police 
departments around the 
country.70 It represents a 
doubling down on the pre-
existing police state by 
sweeping all community 
members into a modern 
surveillance state. The program 
is punitive rather than 
preventative,  and it treats  
certain communities  as  though 
they need to be surveilled for 
inevitable punishment. These 
types of surveillance initiatives 
give police centralized 
discretion over whom to target 
and surveil,  which has 
historically  had a 
disproportionate effect on youth 
of color in poor neighborhoods.71 
Despite the high cost of this 
type of surveillance,  many 
res idents  in surveilled 
communities like these feel 
more watched than protected 
by the police.72 According to 
research,  constantly monitoring 
surveillance and security 
cameras do not substantially 
reduce crime.73 These programs 
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do,  however,  lead to more 
arrests,  prison time,  and costs 
for community members whose 
tax money is funding them.74   
 

 

SOCIAL NETWORK 

ANALYSIS POLICING 
 

Another aggress ive surveillance 
technique used by EBR law 
enforcement is  known as Social 
Network Analys is (SNA).75 This is  
a method for creating visual 
representations,  or sociograms,  
that map groups of people and 
their connections. Law 
enforcement use sociograms to 
identify the most criminogenic 
people and their social c ircles. 
While some claim this is  an 
objective tool for polic ing,  it is  
fundamentally flawed and raises 
the following serious concerns.  
 
F irst,  neither BRPD nor the 
EBRSO has been transparent 
about the methods used to 
target certain groups. According 
to the DOJ,  not all algorithms 
are made equal,  and “making an 
arrest on opaque data and 
without vetting the biases in the 
algorithms used not only raises 
important questions about what 
constitutes reasonable 
suspic ion and probable cause 
but also poses the risk of 

fundamentally altering a legal 
system based on the 
presumption of innocence.”76 To 
avoid this  pitfall,  law 
enforcement agencies and other 
stakeholders should “be aware 
of what data is being used,  how 
it is  being collected,  and how it 
is being analyzed.”77 BRPD and 
EBRSO did not answer Public 
Records Act requests  on this  
topic,  rais ing the question of 
whether these agencies  are 
failing to protect res idents  from 
poss ibly  unethical and 
ineffective predictive polic ing 
programs.  
 
Second,  BRPD Chief Paul has 
been clear that this  data is 
being used to focus on “the 
small group of individuals” who 
drive violent crime in the c ity.78 
He repeatedly  stated in press  
conferences that there is an 
extremely  dangerous “3 to 6  
percent of people responsible” 
for the vast majority  of crime in 
EBR,  and that all policing 
initiatives are meant to keep the 
“other 96 percent” safe.79 While 
it is  unclear where these 
numbers came from,  it is  clear 
that law enforcement agencies  
must surveil and track 
significantly  more than s imply 
the target “3 to 6  percent” in 
order to find their culprits. It 
should concern everyone that 
the police have an openly 
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stated intention to surveil and 
violate the online privacy of all 
in the name of finding a few 
mysterious,  allegedly 
dangerous ,  unnamed 
individuals.  
 
Currently ,  law enforcement 
agencies  are taking information 
from arrest records and 
individuals’ social media 
accounts. However,  this  
technology could eas ily utilize 
other data from other less  
ethical sources such as  facial 
recognition software.80 
Unfortunately,  with the lack of 
transparency exhibited by these 
law enforcement agencies ,  we 
may never know if and when 
such a shift takes place. While 
some police departments  have 
begun to use social network 
analys is  to track people,  this is  
a newer practice and is  not what 
the technique was designed for. 
SNA is  a tool for detecting high 
crime locations ,  and there is not 
enough research to know 
whether shifting the approach to 
individuals is  safe or effective.81 
Even with the location-driven 
approach,  there is great 
variability in the success of SN A 
programs,  as their effectiveness 
depends on the type of police 
intervention and which crimes 
are being addressed.82  
 

Historically,  EBR law 
enforcement agencies have 
targeted Black communities for 
ever-more aggress ive policing 
and increased surveillance. 
However,  the summer of 2020 
brought about a nationwide sea-
change in the conversation 
around the function of polic ing 
in c ities  across America. During 
this mass ive shift,  imagining a 
new and different future without 
deeply  entrenched police 
forces ,  or at least with police 
forces that look drastically  
different from their current 
iterations,  has started to seem 
more realistic in the public  
consciousness. The events that 
gave rise to this  shift,  and what 
this process has looked like in 
Baton Rouge specifically ,  is 
discussed below. 
 
 

2020 PROTESTS 

OVER STRUCTURAL 

RACISM AND POLICE 

BRUTALITY 
 

On May 25 ,  2020,  a M inneapolis  
police officer knelt on George 
Floyd’s neck for almost e ight 
minutes,  after which Mr. F loyd 
stopped responding and was 
pronounced dead within the 
hour.83 In the wake of the police 
killing of Mr. F loyd,  protests 
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erupted in Minneapolis and in 
cities  and towns across America 
against systemic racism and 
police brutality.84 Protests 
intensified as  more Black 
people were killed by police 
during the summer of 2020,  
including: Breonna Taylor, 85 
Rayshard Brooks , 86 Ahmaud 
Arbery , 87 Jacob Blake, 88 Tony 
McDade, 89 and many others.90 
Nationwide,  many protesters 
demanded that police 
departments be defunded and 
that that money be redistributed 
to community  service groups.91 

 
People protested in Baton 
Rouge by gathering outs ide the 
capitol building, 92 marching to 
the D istrict Attorney’s  home;93 
and holding vigils .94 But these 
protests  were not s imply about 
the senseless killing of Mr. 
F loyd and others  across the 
nation—Baton Rougeans also 
protested the beatings and 
killings of many Black people by 
local EBR law enforcement 

agencies  s ince Mr. Sterling’s 
death in 2016: 
 
•  In June of 2017 ,  a BRPD 

officer killed Jordan Frazier 
by shooting him in the back 
as he ran away. Before the 
investigation into the 
shooting was closed,  the 
BRPD awarded the officer its 
Medal of Honor.95 

•  In August of 2018,  that same 
BRPD officer shot at Raheem 
Howard during a routine 
traffic  stop while Mr. Howard 
ran away. Mr. Howard spent 
almost two months in the 
parish prison after being 
charged with attempted 
murder of a police officer 
before the officer’s body 
camera footage was finally 
released,  showing that the 
officer shot at him without 
provocation.  96 

•  On October 24,  2018,  BRPD 
officers  tased,  maced,  and 
beat Steven Young during 
his  arrest for possess ion of 
one marijuana cigarette .97  

•  On May 19,  2019,  Louisiana 
State Patrol officers tased,  
beat,  killed,  and then 
covered up the killing of 
Ronald Greene after he 
attempted to flee from a 
routine traffic v iolation.98  

•  Police body camera footage 
showed that on July  6,  2020,  
a police officer detained 17-

Community  members  have 
given numerous  repor ts  tha t  

BRPD o ff icers ’  pol ice dogs 

have b i tten many Black  

juvenil es  dur ing  ar rest s .  
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year old D illon Cannon by 
forcing a knee on his  neck,  
similar to how George F loyd 
was killed.99  

•  On August 21,  2020,  Trayford 
Pellerin was shot at 11 times 
by Lafayette police officers  
outs ide a gas station while  
he attempted to walk away.100  

•  On August 22,  2020,  Jace 
Boyd,  a white man,  shot 
Danny Buckley,  a Black man,  
to death in a Trader Joe’s  
parking lot.101 BRPD officers 
came to the scene and 
allowed Boyd to leave. Boyd 
was only  arrested many days 
later after an eyewitness,  
whose story BRPD had 
refused to take,  began 
posting her account of how 
Boyd was the aggressor onto 
her Twitter feed.102 

 
And beyond the regular 
beatings and killings of Black 
civilians,  EBR law enforcement 
agencies  have also been 
plagued with misconduct 
allegations: 
 
•  Community members have 

given numerous reports that 
BRPD officers’ police dogs 
have bitten many Black 
juveniles during arrests . 
BRPD officers are reportedly  
more likely  to use police 
dogs to effectuate arrests on 
kids  because,  while BRPD 

officers  must turn on their 
body cameras when they 
draw their weapons,  they do 
not have to turn on their 
body cameras when 
releas ing a dog. 

•  Two police officers ,  whose 
names were not released to 
the public ,  sent numerous 
racist emails from their work 
accounts,  which came to 
light in 2019. The emails  
contained the repeated use 
of the N  word.103 

•  In September of 2020,  
Another BRPD officer was 
placed on leave after 
posting “racist,  sexist,  and 
otherwise offens ive” content 
onto his  personal F acebook 
page.104 

•  After being under a consent 
decree between 1980 and 
2019 for racially  
discriminatory hiring 
practices,  BRPD is still not 
close to achieving racial 
parity amongst its  officers—
as of May 2019,  only  34.4% of 
the BRPD police force is 
Black,  while  55% percent of 
Baton Rouge res idents are 
Black.105 

 
Despite the mass protests in the 
summer of 2020 and these acts  
of police brutality and racism,  
EBR law enforcement agencies 
have not enacted any structural 
changes.106 EBR law 
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enforcement agencies have not 
even attempted to amend their 
polic ies. Instead,  BRPD issued a 
press  release indicating that it 
was “working to re inforce in 
writing what is currently training 
practice” and listed a number of 
policy changes implemented in 
2017 after the killing of Mr. 
Sterling that it would continue 
enforcing.107 Further,  the press 
release indicated that BRPD had 
contracted with Lexipol to 
“evaluate and revise” its polic ies 
and procedures .108 Lexipol,  
however,  is a private 
corporation principally located 
in F risco,  Texas ,  and is  a “little-

known private company with no 
public overs ight” or 
accountability  to the residents 
of Baton Rouge.109  
 
As the history  of polic ing in 
Baton Rouge from the early 
1800s until the present day 
demonstrates,  law enforcement 
agencies  function exactly  as 
they were historically des igned: 
to target poor Black 
neighborhoods and 
disproportionately arrest and 
incarcerate Black people. 
Merely  amending law 
enforcement agencies’ internal 
polic ies will not correct this  
long-lasting and destructive 
course,  especially  when these 
agencies  are not even 
interested in amending their 
polic ies. Part III below 
addresses concerns regarding 
defunding by demonstrating 
how law enforcement agencies  
in EBR have bungled attempts 
at providing social services in 
lieu of incarcerating people . 
These minimally  effective 
agencies  are funded with 
hundreds of millions of tax 
dollars  that could be more 
effectively spent elsewhere. 
 
 
  

Trayford Pellerin (right) and his sister Treneca Pellerin.   
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EBR and the C ity of Baton 
Rouge share a combined budget 
of approximately  $1 billion. 
Within that budget,  BRPD was 
allotted $93, 530, 380 in 2019.110 
EBRSO’s  budget,  however,  is 
not available online . In lieu of 
posting its budgets publicly ,  
EBRSO holds an annual public 
budget meeting at its main 
headquarters,  but it only notifies 
the public  one day before the 
meeting is to take place.111 While 
the full budget is kept a secret,  
some of EBRSO ’s funding 
sources are posted publicly . In 
2020,  EBRSO received almost 
$9 million from the E BR and 
C ity  of Baton Rouge combined 
budget.112 EBRSO also receives 
an annual “millage tax”,  or a 
portion of taxes levied against 
all property  owned in EBR,  
which has raised somewhere 
between $14.6 and $16.7  million 
annually s ince 2015 .113 An EBRSO  
spokesperson stated that this  
amount was about 17% of 
EBRSO’s  total annual budget for 
2020,  which suggests that 
EBRSO’s  overall annual budget 
is approximately $100 million.114 
 

To better understand where all 
this money is going,  we used 
the data from the 2018 arrest 
sweeps to determine the cost of 
arrests to taxpayers . Our 
research shows that over-
polic ing is not only  ineffective—
it is  also extraordinarily 
expensive. 
 
 

THE COST OF AN 

ARREST 
 
An accounting of the cost of 
arresting someone and 
incarcerating them for a period 
of time requires  reasonable 
estimation and making best use 
of the scant records available. 
EBR’s law enforcement agencies  
and parish prison are large 
governmental institutions with 
substantial budgets. The cost of 
arresting 300+ people in a 
month- long sweep will have to 
be approximate and considered 
in the context of overall impact 
of the system and the potential 
of pursuing alternative crime 
reduction methods. Indeed,  
even identify ing which 

PART III: LAW ENFORCEMENT 

AGENCIES TAKE MILLIONS FROM 

SOCIAL SERVICE AGENCIES 

WITHOUT MAKING PEOPLE SAFER 
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individuals were arrested as a 
part of the sweep must be 
determined by taking at face-
value public statements  made 
to the media by law 
enforcement agencies.  
 
The most tangible cost of the 
arrest sweep is the cost of 
incarcerating people. Whether 
this cost was an effective use of 
resources,  and whether it was 
justified,  can only  be 
determined after there is a 
sense of the resources 
expended. The chart below 
displays the operating costs  of 
the East Baton Rouge Parish 
Prison in the 2019 EBR budget.115  
 

This budget represents  
recurring costs in the Parish 
operating budget,  but there are 
likely s ignificant additional 
resources devoted to the prison 
from EBRSO’s  approximately  
$100 million annual budget. 
Based on the best,  most 
detailed,  publicly available data,  
this report only  considers the 
costs  of incarceration covered 
by the Parish operating budget.  
 
The capacity  of the E ast Baton 
Rouge Parish Prison is  currently  
1, 300 people (formerly the 
capacity was 1, 594 but 
substandard conditions led to 
the clos ing of two wings). Based 
on booking data and media 
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reports,  the parish prison 
operates continuously  at 
capacity,  and pays to house 
individuals under EBRSO 
custody at other facilities. G iven 
a daily population of 1, 300,  the 
average monthly  number of 
days spent by individuals in 
custody is  39, 650. The number 
of days individuals  spend 
incarcerated during a 6-month 
period is 237, 900. If the 6-
month operating budget is  
$7, 539, 360,  then that leaves a 
daily per person incarceration 
cost of $31.69.  
 
During the period of the 
sweeps,  from N ovember 15 ,  
2018 to December 19,  2018,  
1, 241 people were booked into 
the EBR Prison. The stated 
purpose of the sweeps was to 
focus on drug and weapon 
offenses ,  and it was claimed by 
BRPD that 300+ drug and 
weapon arrests  were made as a 
result of the sweeps. According 
to booking records,  the number 
of people arrested on drug and 
weapons charges during the 
sweep was 394,  a figure that 
approximately corresponds to 
claims BRPD made to the media. 
 
Overall cost to taxpayers can be 
roughly  approximated by 
determining a pro-rata hourly 
rate for BRPD and EBRSO staff. 
Even assuming a modest two 

hours  per arrest,  the cost of law 
enforcement labor for arresting 
these 394 people was 
$80, 202.64. As of July  12,  2019,  
these 394 people spent a 
minimum of 44, 525 pre-trial 
days incarcerated before their 
release. G iven the daily cost of 
incarceration per person,  plus 
the cost of arresting them,  that 
means the total cost to the 
Parish was $1, 491, 199.89 . A  
remarkable sum,  considering 
that—as addressed in other 
sections of this  report—there 
was no discernable impact on 
the homicide rate in Baton 
Rouge,  which was not 
abnormally  high before the 
sweep. And again,  the vast 
majority  of arrests  were for low-
level drug offenses.    
 
The monetary cost to the Parish,  
however,  is only a small part of 
the cost of the sweeps. The real 
cost is  in mass ive breach of 
trust between community 
members and police and the 
tremendous disruption to the 
lives of those who were caught 
up in it.  There is  a general 
damage to the economy when 
people are removed from the 
workforce to await trial,  but 
there is  also an undocumented 
and often irreparable impact on 
their lives and those of their 
families. Instead of arresting and 
incarcerating people,  the funds 
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that are earmarked for law 
enforcement agencies should 
be re invested directly into 
social services and programs. 
Yet,  as  the following section 
shows,  EBR law enforcement 
agencies  have proved 
themselves incapable of 
ensuring that such funds will be 
properly re invested into the 
community. 
 
 

BRAVE PROGRAM 
 
After a failed and highly 
critic ized era of “broken 
windows” polic ing,  in which 
police would target and punish 
low levels of crimes hoping to 
prevent worse crimes, 116 Baton 
Rouge joined a nationwide 
experiment in predictive 
polic ing in September of 2012. 
This experiment attempted to 
identify at-risk individuals and 
invite them to “call- in sess ions” 
to warn them that “v iolent 
incidents  by any group member 
will result in a coordinated 
effort by law enforcement on 
the entire  group.”117 At the same 
time,  these “call- in sess ions” 
were supposed to serve as a 
gateway to social services and 
provide alternatives to criminal 
activ ities .118 Group policing 
encourages police to target 
“violent” areas—almost always 
poor communities of color—by 

identify ing groups for 
surveillance us ing social media,  
on-the-street observation,  and 
past incidents and arrests. 
 
In Baton Rouge,  this version of 
tough-on-crime polic ing was 
called the Baton Rouge Area 
Violence E limination Initiative 
(BRAVE ). The federal 
government awarded the C ity  of 
Baton Rouge,  in conjunction 
with the E ast Baton Rouge 
Parish D istrict Attorney ’s  
Office , 119 over $3 million in 
grants to run BRAVE,  which was 
supposed to identify  12-  to 24-
year-olds known to be 
associated with gangs and 
provide them with a path away 
from crime through a 
combination of social services 
and group polic ing. BRAVE  
focused only on two specific 
z ip-codes within the parish,  
70802 and 70805,  which are 
75.3% and 94.3% Black,  
respectively,  with over a third of 
both areas’ res idents liv ing 
under the poverty  level.120 LSU 
spent all of the nearly  $700, 000 
it was allocated to identify  “at 
risk” youth,  often through social 
media,  and to track them in a 
database in coordination with 
the Baton Rouge D istrict 
Attorney’s  office and the 
BRPD.121  
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The “call- in sessions” for the “at-
risk” young adults were held at 
the 19th Judicial District 
Courthouse. Police warned 
attendees that they had been 
identified as  “at-risk, ” that 
“v iolence would not be 
tolerated, ” and that police 
would arrest “entire  groups” the 
next time there was a shooting.122 
As a result,  many “local and 

federal prosecutions stemmed 
from BRAVE -related 
crackdowns.”123 Mass indictments 
of entire  “groups” (the BRAVE  
program did not refer to them 
as “gangs” for optics purposes) 
were celebrated as  proof of the 
efficacy of the program.124 
 
The social services component 
of BRAVE,  however,  never lived 
up to its promise. Between 
January of 2013 and September 
of 2017 ,  only  105 kids were 
given any support services,  with 
most only receiving ass istance 
with “transportation” and “job 
seeking.”125 The BRAVE 
program’s final report does not 
indicate with any specific ity  
what such ass istance entailed,  
or whether it included more 
than simply  a car ride 
somewhere or a case manager 
giving one-time job seeking 
advice.126 BRAVE  was originally  
intended to fund local service 
organizations like job-readiness 
trainings,  mentorship programs,  
mental health services,  and arts  
camps.127 Because of 
bureaucratic  slow-downs and 
in-fighting,  and despite an 
abundance of service providers,  
the social services component 
of the grant was deeply  
underfunded. F or example,  by 
2016,  BRAVE  had failed to 
spend $1.69 million of the $3 
million in total funding Credit: Guido Coppa via Unsplash 
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allocated,  while all of the 
money allocated to law 
enforcement for data-collection 
on these youths was spent 
quickly .128 Local community  
members lamented that the 
community-based churches that 
were intended to be part of the 
program were not being 
utilized,  which wasted offerings 
such as  a free GED 
programming,  legal services,  
and mentoring.129 By June of 
2017,  the offic ials in charge of 
BRAVE  had neglected the social 
services requirements of the 
grant so severely  that the 
Department of Justice refused 
to renew funding for the 
initiative . When the five-year 
grant expired in September of 
2017,  nearly  one million dollars 
was left unspent.130 As Reverend 
Conway Knighton of St. Mary  
Baptist C hurch explained,  
BRAVE  was a “major 
disappointment, ” and,  despite 
promise at its  inception,  “it did 
not make its way to the 
community.”131  
 
Research shows that gang 
prevention programs that 
provide counseling to children 
around community education 
and awareness are more 
effic ient and cost-effective than 
incarceration.132 Alternatively,  
criminalizing and incarcerating 
entire social networks of 

children has been shown to 
exacerbate cycles of poverty 
and crime while creating 
enormous barriers  to pro-social 
development.133 Despite its 
funding mandate,  BRAVE  
neglected social services and 
disproportionately overfunded 
the enhanced punishment part 
of the formula. 
 
In the end,  BRAVE’s  failure to 
focus on positive social 
programming led the program 
to an embarrass ing collapse in 
2017. After BRAVE ’s five years 
and over one million dollars 
spent,  the number of homicides 
in Baton Rouge had gone from 
113 at BRAVE ’s start in 2012 to 
88 in 2013,  112 in 2014,  131 in 
2015,  139 in 2016,  all the way up 
to 239 in 2017  when BRAVE ’s 
funding was refused,  before 
falling to 176 in 2018,  and 93 
through June 2019.134 BRAVE 
represents  the time-proven fact 
that law enforcement agencies  
are utterly inept at investing 
money into social services 
instead of into more polic ing.  
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POLICY 

RECOMMENDATIONS 
 
Given the overwhelming history  
of distrust between Black 
communities and law 
enforcement agencies after 
centuries  of discriminatory and 
violent polic ing,  it is no surprise 
that EBR’s ever-more 
aggressive police tactics  
continue to fail.  
 
It is finally  time to completely  
re-envis ion the function,  
purpose,  and existence of 
polic ing agencies .  Police 
ostensibly exist for the primary 
purpose of keeping the public  
safe. But we must be explic it 
about whose safety  is 
implicated by the rhetoric  of 
“public safety.” As  Jos ie Duffy 
Rice recently wrote: 
 

“America has never truly  had 
a system of ‘public safety, ’  if 
only because Black ‘safety ’ 
has  historically  been 
imagined as  being secured 
by more polic ing,  whereas 
white ‘safety’ is ensured by 
altogether different means . 
America does not flood the 
dorms of Harvard with cops 
because they are areas of 
‘known drug activ ity.’  It does 
not station armed officers  in 
the cubicles  of Wells  F argo. 

The white parents of 
Westchester do not generally 
have to subject their 
teenagers  to The Talk. White 
safety,  itself built on a 
foundation of enslavement 
and segregation,  is ensured 
through familial wealth,  home 
ownership,  well-funded 
public schools,  stable 
employment,  and health care. 
Black safety  is  ensured by 
‘zero tolerance policing’ and 
‘stop and frisk.’”135 

 
Further,  calling the police is 
hardly an option for Black 
people worried about becoming 
the next person to be shot to 
death by a police officer. Put 
simply,  “Armed human beings ,  
officially trained in effic ient 
methods of administering death 
and violence,  should not be 
dispatched in response to a 
Black woman experiencing an 
episode related to a psychiatric  
disability.”136 Yet such armed 
human beings are currently the 
only available resource in many 
situations,  such as  for handling 
mental health crises ,  patrolling 
school hallways,  and 
responding to 911 calls about 
issues ranging from noise 
complaints to domestic  abuse.137 
In the vast majority of these 
situations,  trained social 
workers would be far superior 
first responders  over police 
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officers  who are e ither severely 
undertrained or entirely  
untrained in working with 
people with acute mental health 
needs.  
 
If the past two centuries of 
racist police brutality have 
taught us anything,  we must 
now imagine new community-
based substitutes for polic ing,  
or people of color and poor 
people will continue to be 
disproportionately incarcerated 
and killed. 
 
F unding for EBR law 
enforcement agencies should 
be redirected into investments  
in services and programs that 
enable people to live healthy,  
crime-free lives ,  thus improving 
public  safety  more effectively  
than investing in law 
enforcement.138 Abolishing the 
police means that community 
agencies  must step in to take 
over roles  previously controlled 
by law enforcement agencies . 
Requiring law enforcement 
agencies  to self- reform has 
never been effective. As 
indicated by the failure of the 
BRAVE  program,  funds 
administered mainly through law 
enforcement agencies are 
consistently  funneled into 
punitive and aggress ive 
polic ing,  while neglecting 
community investment. Instead,  

police funds should be 
redistributed to social services 
like education,  social work,  
housing,  drug treatment,  
healthcare,  and transportation. 
These programs should 
prioritize the leadership of 
people with the most 
investment and experience in 
the community—the community 
members themselves.  
 
The following policy 
recommendations are 
secondary alternatives to the 
abolition of police and the 
re investment of all polic ing 
funds into social service 
agencies . 
 
If EBR law enforcement 
agencies continue to exist in 
any capacity ,  the broad 
discretion delegated to them 
must be severely curtailed.  
Experts  have found that “[t]o ask 
police to pick and choose which 
laws to enforce and how 
vigorously  is a recipe for 
continued disparities due to 
excess ive discretion,  and 
growing distrust of police.”139 
Baton Rouge res idents’ calls  to 
the police for minor,  non-violent 
issues ,  too frequently cause 
overly-aggress ive,  v iolent 
police officers to escalate 
situations and kill community  
members. An anonymous tip to 
the police led to the killing of 
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Alton Sterling in 2016 ,  as 
discussed above,  and as  
recently as July 25 ,  2019,  
another tip led Baton Rouge 
police to enter a room without 
knocking and fatally shoot Josef 
Richardson in the back of the 
head within seconds.140 E mpirical 
and anecdotal evidence shows 
that aggressively  targeting,  
surveilling,  harass ing,  and 
arresting huge swaths of the 
community with blanket polic ies 

only decrease public  trust in the 
police and overall public  safety. 
Instead of try ing to catch up 
with high-tech aggressive 
polic ing practices that have 
consistently  failed elsewhere,  
EBR must require intens ive 
transparency for law 
enforcement action,  both 
internally and externally. 
 
The Baton Rouge Union of 
Police ’s contract must be 
s ignificantly amended to allow 
for collective bargaining and 
access to officers ’ misconduct 
records . According to the 2016 
union contract,  EBR police 
officers  are given immediate 
access to any investigation 
records about their 
misconduct.141 This  deters  
people from bringing complaints 
in the first place because there 
is no anonymity. Additionally,  all 
“letters  of instruction,  letters of 
caution,  or counseling letters” 
are purged from an officer’s 
record after one year,  and all 
complaints that result in 
suspension are destroyed after 
five years.142 These polic ies  are 
inapposite to BRPD’s stated 
goals  of transparency ,  
openness,  and mutual trust 
between the community and the 
police. 
 
Additionally,  during the summer 
of 2020,  the Baton Rouge Union Credit: Wesley Marcal via Unsplash 
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of Police put up roadside 
billboards with slogans such as  
“DE FEND THE  BADGE ,  NOT THE  
CRIMINAL, ” alongside text 
listing Baton Rouge as the fifth 
deadliest c ity  in America,  and 
“WARNIN G: EN TER AT YO UR 
OWN RISK”,  accompanied with 
the EBR homicide count for the 
year.143 These scare tactics are 
meant to make people liv ing in 
EBR believe that more polic ing 
is the only poss ible means to 
ensure community safety. 
However,  as this report has 
outlined,  more polic ing leads to 
more brutality  and less 
community trust. The s ignificant 
power and influence wielded by 
the Baton Rouge Union of Police 
needs to be curtailed,  as shown 
by the fact that “[v]irtually all of 
the published items that express 
an opinion on the impact of 
police unions regard them as 
having a negative effect,  
particularly  on innovation,  
accountability  and police-
community relations.”144 
 
E ast Baton Rouge should listen 
to the hundreds of its  
community  members and the 
Baton Rouge Immigrants ’ Rights  
C oalition who have already 
demanded an end to the 
harmful and counter-productive 
ICE agreements. When punitive 
measures and over-polic ing 
unsurprisingly  fail to reduce 

high crime rates,  law 
enforcement often place blame 
and responsibility on the 
community itself.145 Specifically ,  
police frequently ask 
community members to report 
their own neighbors and peers 
to the police. That request falls 
flat because it is incompatible 
with the overwhelmingly  
negative relationship the police 
have created with these 
communities. One way that EBR 
has fostered a relationship of 
mistrust is with its partic ipation 
in 287(g) agreements . E BR is  
one of a mere 90 jurisdictions in 
the country  and one of only 
three parishes in Louis iana that 
signed a 287(g) agreement with 
U.S. Immigration and Customs 
Enforcement (ICE).146 These 
287(g) agreements give local 
law enforcement officers  certain 
deportation powers ,  giv ing any 
member of E BR’s immigrant 
communities sound reason to 
fear all police officers. These 
agreements understandably  
reduce public  trust in the 
police,  discourage crime 
reporting,  and undercut efforts 
to curb violent crime.147 EBR 
powerholders  should listen to 
the hundreds of community 
members and the Baton Rouge 
Immigrants ’ Rights  Coalition who 
have already demanded an end 
to the harmful and counter-
productive 287(g) agreements.148 
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CONCLUSION 
 
These policy recommendations 
are meant to serve as a 
reference in the re- imagining of 
the future of E BR law 
enforcement. All work should be 
done in conjunction with 
community partners  and those 
directly  impacted by EBR 
polic ing forces ,  specifically 
Black res idents of EBR. 
 
As explained in this  report,  
EBR’s brutal and racist polic ing 
history  span the 19th,  20th,  and 
into the 21st centuries. While 
advocating for abolition of the 

police may seem at first glance 
to be a wildly controvers ial 
measure,  when seen next to the 
fact that policing in E BR has 
been a violent and racist 200-
year experiment without any 
real poss ibility  of a different 
outcome,  abolition begins to 
look s ignificantly  more rational 
than continuing on this same 
well-worn path. In the aftermath 
of George Floyd’s killing,  with 
the momentum of nationwide 
protests  and the current 
powerful reckoning with 
America’s  polic ing history of 
brutality and racism,  now is  the 
time to reflect on what has been 
and to decide what will be. 

Demonstrators confronted lines of riot officers near police headquarters in Baton Rouge. 

Credit: Reuters via BBC 
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